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"Where the Writer Meets the Road" Hardcover Book by Sam Posey
Similar Products. All comments are moderated: you will see it, but until it's approved no one else will. This reader only wishes that there were more
here to enjoy. It also reflects his innate curiosity and enthusiasm for a wide range of non-automotive interests such as painting, art, design and
architecture. Email to friends Share on Facebook - opens in a new window or tab Share on Twitter - opens in a new window or tab Share on
Pinterest - opens in a new window or tab Add to Watchlist. Watch list is full. On May at PDT, seller added the following information:. Can't
recommend it enough. Sell now - Have one to sell? Facebook Google. Not expected to have inside pages damaged or missing. Seller does not
offer returns. Innearing the end of his active driving career, his autobiography The Mudge Pond Express was published ISBN ; good luck finding
one today at an affordable price. Make Offer. Zambia Zimbabwe There are 1 items available. Estimated between Wed. Learn More - opens in a
new window or tab International shipping and import charges paid to Pitney Bowes Inc. Item Information Condition:. Refresh and try again. No
additional import charges at delivery! Criticisms are few, but I would have preferred a more chronological order to the Broadcast Intros and
Profiles. I'm your Daddy. Refer to eBay Return policy for more details. Author: Sam Posey. Welcome back. For more than 40 years, racing fans
all over the world Broadcast Intros and Profiles followed Sam Posey's unique career as a driver, writer, and broadcaster. See all. Learn More -
opens in a new window or tab Any international shipping and import charges are paid in part to Pitney Bowes Inc. Enlarge cover. Learn more.
Shipping to: Worldwide. Special financing available Select PayPal Credit at checkout to have the option to pay over time. In that case, we can't I
was disappointed that, for instance, the classic photo of Sam brawling with Peter Revson in the Riverside Trans-Am pits was not included. Mouse
over to Zoom - Click to enlarge. Add to Watchlist Unwatch. Shipping cost cannot be calculated. Item specifics Condition: Like New : A book
that looks new but has been read. Return to Book Page. No matter what the venue or circumstances, Posey's writing captures the excitement of
racing as well as an insider's understanding of how the sport really works, both on and off the track. People who viewed this item also viewed. In
the s he not only won Where the Writer Meets the Road: A Collection of Articles Sebring and finished Where the Writer Meets the Road: A
Collection of Articles the podium at Le Mans, but also published a highly regarded autobiography. May be very minimal identifying marks on the
inside cover. Learn more - eBay Money Back Guarantee - opens in new window or tab. Learn more - opens in a new window or tab. Open
Preview See a Problem? See other items More Sign up to receive the weekly newsletter featuring the very latest from Petrolicious. Showing
Readers also enjoyed.
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