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Handy science answer book

Genre/Form: Trivia and miscellaneaMiscellanea Additional physical format: Online version:Handy science answer bookCanton, MI : Visible Ink Press, [2020](DLC) 2019017609 Document type: Book All authors / Contributors: James E Bobick; Naomi E Balaban; Carnegie Library in Pittsburgh. More information about: James E Bobick
Naomi E Balaban ISBN: 9781578596911 1578596912 OCLC Number: 1097365530 Description: xi, 611 pages : illustrations ; 24 cm Content: General Science -- Mathematics -- Physics -- Chemistry -- Astronomy and Space -- Geology and Earth Science -- Meteorology and Climatology -- Biology -- Genetics -- Botany -- Zoology -- Anatomy
and Physiology -- Ecology -- Medicine and Technology. Responsibility: respected by the Carnegie Library of Pittsburgh ; edited by James E. Bobick and Naomi E. Balaban. An informative, easy-to-use guide to everyday scientific questions, concepts and basics celebrates its twenty-fifth year and more than one million copies sold! Science
is everywhere and affects everything! DNA and CRISPR. Artificial sweeteners. Sea level changes caused by melting glaciers. Gravitational waves. Bees in the colony. The human body. Microplastics. The largest active volcano. Designer of dog breeds. Molecules. The length of the Grand Canyon. Viruses and retroviruses. The weight of
the cloud. Strength, movement, energy and inertia. It can often seem complicated and complicated, but it doesn't have to be so difficult to understand. The thoroughly updated and completely revised fifth edition of The Handy Science Answer Book makes science and its impact on the world fun and easy to understand. Bright, concise and
simple, this informative primer covers hundreds of intriguing topics, from the basics of mathematics, physics and chemistry to discoveries about the human body, stars, space, rivers, mountains and the planet as a whole. Includes plants, animals, computers, planes, trains and cars. This friendly resource answers over 1600 frequently
asked, most interesting and most unusual scientific questions. For anyone who wants to know how the universe, earth, plants, animals and human beings work and fit into our world, this information book also includes a helpful bibliography and an extensive index, adding to its usefulness. This will help anyone with scientific questions! Why
do golf balls have wells? What makes people snore? How does fax work? Answers to these and 1250 others are frequently asked, but it is difficult to explain the questions you can find in this tom. Revised and expanded, the second edition of this bestselling book deals with dozens of sci-tech thematic areas, including human body, space,
environment, weights and measurements, chemistry and physics and many more. Illustrations. Showing 1-30 Start your review of Handy Science Answer Book Jul 10, 2008 Lafcadio rated it amazing · Review Recommended for: Comet Recommended to Lafcadio by: Richard This book is faded and the edges of the pages are well worn
out. I use this book at least once a week to check something, and sometimes I just open a random page and start reading. This book did me good. Mar 30, 2020 Theresa said she really enjoyed · review of the next edition of The Handy Science Answer Book (4. A handy science answer book (4th by the Carnegie Library of PittsburghUse
as a resource for my science class, has a simplified description of terminology. Unfortunately I wish there were more answers about geology, so I can use it for more of my class presentations. Item title: Carnegie Library, Pittsburgh. (2011). Useful scientific response book. (4th ed.). Guangzhou, MI: Visible ink. Quote created by: Michele
PowellFormat: HandbookCall Number: 500 HANDescription: An updated version with 2200 questions and answers on scientific topics. Professional review: Faust, T.R. (2011). Reviews [Book review Handy science response book, by The Carnegie Library of Pittsburg]. Library Journal 136(10), 122-128.Relevance and Relationship: This
book title: Carnegie Library, Pittsburgh. (2011). Useful scientific response book. (4th ed.). Guangzhou, MI: Visible ink. Quote created by: Michele PowellFormat: HandbookCall Number: 500 HANDescription: An updated version with 2200 questions and answers on scientific topics. Professional review: Faust, T.R. (2011). Reviews [Book
review Handy science response book, by The Carnegie Library of Pittsburg]. Library Journal 136(10), 122-128.Relevance and Relationship: This book would be suitable for collections analyzed during my field of experience because it will provide students with educational trivia books that are not currently in the collection. The printed
edition is very affordable at a price of $ 21.95. Objective: The purpose of this reference is to support the student's research. Suitable for classes 4-12. Validity: Reviewed and recommended in the library log. Format: Printing and e-book available. Layout and presentation: The Q&amp;A format, divided by scientific disciplines, includes
photographs, illustrations and graphs, and an extensive index. Diversity: The presentation of the material helps to meet the needs of struggling readers. ... more I was offered this book for Christmas and really enjoyed every word of it. Well presented with many different Science &amp; Tech. topics, everyone answered in clear and simple
sentences. It even helped me with a geology project at the University. Mar 22, 2015 Terri said he liked the fact that I got acquainted with the latest edition. It would take a few months to read the whole thing because it's all facts. However, I'm thinking about buying this to keep myself at home for grandchildren to use and it is in small doses.
On July 11, 2014, Morgan said it was amazing read this book over and over again as a child. I am fascinated by bizarre questions and surprising answers. I dare say That I wouldn't be such a good science student if it weren't for this book. August 22, 2008 Amy thought it was amazing This book really helps if you have a common question
about science and a lot of information about things you've never thought about. Bess rated it really enjoyed November 15, 2007 Amy R rated him liked it November 26, 2012 Julie rated it amazing Jun 12, 2008 Joshua Maher rated that he really liked it October 26, 2015 Jeff rated it amazing Mar 23, 2018 David rated, that I really liked it Jul
03, 2015 Alyssa Rodgers rated that she really liked it mar 20, 2014 Elaine rated it amazing November 10, 2007 Linda said she really liked it May 27, 2012 Email to a friend Quick FACTS ISBN: 97815785969 11 e ISBN Book: 9781578597024 Published 2019 624 pages 140 photos and illustrations 7-1/8 x 9-1/4 soft $22.95 Similar titles You
can also enjoy ... Handy Anatomy Answer Book, Second Edition Handy Answer Book for Children (and Parents), Second Edition Handy Astronomy Answer Book, Third Edition Handy Biology Answer Book, Second Edition Handy Chemistry Answer Book The Handy Forensic Science Answer Book: Reading Clues at the Crime Scene,
Crime Lab, and in Court The Handy Math Answer Book, Second Edition The Handy Ocean Answer Book The Handy Physics Answer Book, Second Edition The Handy Psychology Answer Book, Second Edition The Handy Technology Answer Book, Second Edition The Handy Ocean Answer Book The Handy Physics Answer Book The
Handy Physics Answer Book, Second Edition The Handy Psychology Answer Book, Secondy Handy Technology Answer Book also by Naomi Balaban... Handy Technology Answer Book
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