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In light of current events related to coronavirus, CBFS will be closed until further notice. The health and safety of our participants and employees is our number one priority. We carefully monitor the status of COVID-19 and update protective measures and policies as appropriate. Our staff takes all necessary cleaning precautions in our
housing, food service, and lab/office space, so we will be able to restart the programming as soon as possible. Continue to monitor our website for up-to-date information about CBFS programs. Remember to wash your hands often with soap and water, do not touch your face, and practice safe distancing! Upcoming Programs &amp;
Events: Consider befri keeping cbfs or making a donation to help support our mission. CBFS sends out monthly e-newsletters that keep you up to date on upcoming programs, events, and news from the field station. Click the button below to subscribe! Subscribe to our E-newsletter This guide is a comprehensive overview of the fun
activities included in our programs as well as fees and schedule for the year. Don't miss the latest updates and options for your practical, feet wet adventure! Chincoteague Bay Field Station is currently pursuing a proposal to work with a community member to relocate and preserve the Franklin City train depot. We are optimistic about this
possibility and will continue to keep the community informed of the status of the building. Read the Eastern Shore Post article here. IN THE NEWS: Shippensburg University article highlights the importance of the 50th anniversary. MORE&gt; on the blog: Marine mammal summer course at CBFS adds dolphin ID's to long-term regional
databases. MORE&gt; Vacancies: 2Position Duration: March - NovemberOm position: Chincoteague Bay Field Station prepares for the upcoming season. We are currently searching for motivate individuals to join our household department. Cleaning experience preferred, but would train the right person if needed. Working hours are from
8:00 to 16:30 and must be available for work on Saturday. To apply: Applications can be completed on site Monday-Thursday, 9:00 to 03:00 or download the application online and submit it to our offices. Application end date: March 5, 2020 DOWNLOAD APPLICATION HERE Question? Contact:John BeseckerCBFS Facilities & Grounds
DeptPhone: (757)-824-5636 ext. 10134001 Mill Dam Road Wallops Island, VA 23337 Applications for summer 2020 are closed. Check January 2021 for 2021 applications. Number of vacancies: 1Position dates: Approx. 4 May - 8 August 200 kroner stipend, room and board Would you like to have management experience in both field and
residential environments to facilitate the practical educational experience for university students? U&amp;R Internal Supervisor has among other leading kajakture in time-and-time escort groups to NASA's Wallops Island, oversee residential aspects of the college community, and complete various physical and administrative tasks to meet
the program's goals. U&amp;R Intern Supervisor reports to the Director of University &amp; Research, is part of the Field Station's training team and assists in the supervision of U&amp;R Interns in all aspects of their job. Full Job Description FOR MORE INFO CONTACT: Kelsey GustafsonDirector of the University & Research
universityandresearch @cbfieldstation.org(757)824-5636 x 105 Chincoteague Bay Field Station is also proud to offer college internships! Chincoteague Bay Field Station is an equal opportunities employer. In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, the association will provide reasonable accommodations to qualified persons
with disabilities and encourage both potential and current employees to discuss potential housing with the employer.  CBFS is dedicated to the goal of building a culturally diverse and pluralistic staff engaged in teaching and working in a multicultural environment, and strongly encourages minority applicants. Chincoteague Bay Field
Station (CBFS) is dedicated to providing outstanding interdisciplinary, educational and research opportunities for all and does not discriminate in providing services on the basis of race, color, national origin, age, disability, sexual orientation, gender identification or expression, or any other basis prohibited by law.   Chincoteague Bay Field
Station is an environmental center and residential research station on Virginia's Eastern Shore. For decades, CBFS has taught and inspired thousands of children, college students and adults about marine science and coastal ecology in the Mid-Atlantic region. From horseshoe crabs to sharks, our programs educate participants through
field-based, hands-on experiences in locations located on the islands of Chincoteague, Assateague, Wallops and beyond! Chincoteague Bay Field Station is a great place to plan a family vacation, school field trip or outdoor adventure! Some of their programs include Family Camps, Road Scholar Programs, Birding Trips, Bike Tours,
Kayak Tours, Photography and Folk Art Workshops, Day Camps, Oceanic Research Boat Tours, School Field Trips, College Summer Courses and Summer Camps. The wide range of programs offered by Field Station is amazing! Chincoteague Bay Field Station can even develop marine science training programs to suit your group's
needs. The beaches, marshes, coves, maritime forests and off-shore waters of Virginia's Eastern Shore are field station classrooms. Their facilities include new residential suites, dining room, lounges, auditorium, classrooms/meeting rooms, research labs and flat bottom boats and oceanic research vessels. Chincoteague Bay Station
offers a wonderful range of options to meet your educational and/or research goals. Since 1968, Chincoteague Bay Field Station has educated and inspired thousands of children, young people and adults about the marine and coastal ecosystems along the Mid-Atlantic region through fun and scientific place-based, hands-on experiences.
You can be next! For a complete and current program list visit field station's website or to sign up for an upcoming event or program, please contact Chincoteague Bay Field Station at 773-824-5636. LEARN MORE Summer Camps 2020 Summer Camps: CBFS summer camps are the perfect way to jump back into the open air! Day camps
run Monday to Friday and introduce campers to a variety of coastal ecosystems and the interesting animals that live there. Accommodation camps allow your camper to create their own personal marine science adventure! Choose from a variety of classes ranging from fish biology to coastal crafts to kayaking and research-based boat
trips. Check out the dates and prices for CBFS summer camps at www.cbfieldstation.org/youth-camps Friday Adventure Series: CBFS is excited to introduce our Friday Adventure Series! Join us for a half day program that delves deeper into the science and natural history that makes the Chincoteague region unique. Kayak, bike, or
explore the marsh and beach with us - adventure awaits! Program dates, prices and activities can be found at For a full list of island events and activities, CLICK HERE 34001 Mill Dam Rd, Wallops Island, VA, US 233373287 Person waren hier �tzige Organization · UmweltschutzunternehmenDerzeit geschlossen·08:30 - 16:30Derzeit
geschlossen·08:30 - 16:30MontagDienstagMittwochDonnersFretagitagSamtagsSonntag08:30 - 16:3008:30 - 301 6:3008:30 - 16:3008:30 - 16:3008:30 - 16:30GESCHSENGESCHLOSSENAll ansehenSeitentransparenzFacebook möchte mit diesen Informationen transparents machen, worum es beier seite geht. Hier erfährst du mehr zu
den Person, die seiten verwalten und Beiträge darin posten. All pronounced The Chincoteague Bay Field Station is a residential environmental education and field station on the Eastern Shore of Virginia. Field Station provides excellent interdisciplinary, educational and research opportunities that celebrate the rich natural, cultural,
economic and technological resources of the Mid-Atlantic coastal region through field-based and hands-on learning, often related to several public and private partners. Partners.
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