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Old right vs new right apush

U.S. history For many Americans, the economic, social and political trends of the previous two decades - from crime and racial polarization in many urban centers, to the recession and inflation of the Carter years - caused a disillusioned mood. It also reinforces a new suspicion of the government and its ability to effectively deal with the
country's deep social and political problems. The Conservative Party, which has long lost power at the national level, is well positioned to harness this new mood. It was a time when many Americans were receiving their message of limited government, strong defense and defending traditional values against what is considered the
encroachment of a modern society that allows and often chaoss. This conservative insurgency has many sources. A large group of orthodox Christians, who regard the Bible as Direct and errant words of God, are particularly concerned about the rise of crime and sexual inscrimation. One of the most politically effective groups in the early
1980s, known as the Moral Majority, was led by a Baptist minister, Jerry Falwell. Another organization, led by Pat Robertson, built an organization called the Christian Coalition which in the 1990s was a powerful force in the Republican Party. Like so many groups, they want to return religion to a central place in American life. TV
missionaries such as Falwell and Robertson have developed huge followers. A galvanizing issue for conservatives is one of the most divisive and emotional issues of the time: abortion. Protesting the 1973 Supreme Court decision, Roe v. Wade, which maintains a woman's right to an abortion in the early months of her pregnancy, gathers
a wide range of organizations and individuals. They include, but are not limited to, large numbers of Catholics, political conservatives and religious fundamentals, most of them consider abortion in virtually any case equivalent to murder. They were prepared to hold backs on politicians who agreed with their positions - and against those
who disagreed with it. Pro-choice and anti-abortion protests have become a fixity of the political landscape. In the Republican Party, the right once again prevailed. The right-wing briefly took control of the Republican Party in 1964 with its presidential candidate, Barry Goldwater, then fading from the limelight. By 1980, however, with the
use of modern fundraising techniques, the right had overtaken the moderate wing of the party. Based on the intellectual firepower of conservatives such as economists Milton Friedman, journalists William F. Buckley and George Will, and research organizations such as the Heritage Foundation, the New Right played an important role in
identifying the problems of the 1980s. Like other conservatives, or the Old Right, the Right to strictly supported government intervention in the economy. But the new Right is willing to use state power to encourage its views on family values, curb homosexual behavior and censor pornography. In general, the New Right also advocates
tough measures against crime, strong defense, constitutional amendments to allow prayer in public schools, opposition to abortion and the failure of the Equal Rights Amendment for Women. The character who drew all the different strands together was Ronald Reagan. Reagan, who was born in Illinois, became a star as an actor in
Hollywood films and television before moving into politics. He first gained political prominence with a nationally broadcast speech in 1964 in support of Barry Goldwater. In 1966, Reagan won the california governor's office, due to a wave of voter reaction against the student uprising at the University of California-Berkeley, and served until
1975. He narrowly missed out on winning the Republican presidential nomination in 1976 before succeeding in 1980 and going on to win the presidency from Jimmy Carter. Reagan won reel reel election in 1984 against Carter's vice president, Walter Mondale. President Reagan's indisputable optimism and his ability to celebrate the
achievements and aspirations of the American people persisted throughout his two term in office. He was a assured and stable character for many Americans. Despite his tendency for misstatements, Reagan was known as the Great Communicator, primarily for his mastery of television. To many, he recalls the relative social prosperity
and tranquility of the 1950s - an era dominated by a genial public persona who evoked widespread sentiment, President Dwight Eisenhower. Reagan believed that the government penetrated too deeply into American lives. He wants to cut programs that he argues the country doesn't need by eliminating waste, fraud and abuse.
Throughout his term, Reagan also pursued a more thorough de-regulation program than started by Jimmy Carter. Reagan sought to eliminate regulations affecting consumers, workplaces and the environment that he considered inefficient, costly and hindering economic growth. Source: U.S. Department of State For specific bodies known
as New Permissions, see New Permissions (orientation). Right-wing politics emerged in the 1960s Part of the political series Political Party political spectrum left far-left Center Center LeftRadical Center-right Center Center Center center-right Center-rightFar-right Party platform An communist communist social democratic progressive
liberal liberal Republicans synchronized democratic democrats International Green Environment Third Way Conservative Royalist National Statistical Capitalist Fascist Party Organized Party Cartel Party Catch-all Party Business Party Mass Party Party Leader Party Secretary Party Chairman Party Spokesperson Non-partisan System
Party One party dominates the two partiesMulti-party Ruling Opposition Party Hung Parliament Confidence and provides minority government Major Coalition Coalition National Unity Government The majority government lists the ruling parties by country Political parties by regional political ideology portalvte New Right is a term for right-
wing political groups or different policies in different countries. It was also used to describe the appearance of Eastern European parties after the collapse of the Soviet Union. [1] The history of The New Right emerged during Barry Goldwater's 1964 presidential campaign to appoint an appearance, in response to liberalism (in the American
sense of the term [i.e., social liberalism]), of an unlimited right: extremely conservative, instilled in religious values, populist openness, anti-equality, and intolerance of racism. Popularized by Richard Viguerie, the term was later used to describe a broader movement in the English-speaking world: socially conservative supporters of the
night-time watch state, such as Ronald Reagan, Margaret Thatcher, or New Zealand First. But, as Jean-Yves Camus and Nicolas Lebourg point out, this tilt has only a few things in common with the New European Right that has emerged since the 1960s, inspired by conservative revolutionary Moeller van den Bruck rather than by the
classical liberal Adam Smith. [2] Australia's new australian right, the New Right refers to a movement towards the late 1970s/1980s both inside and outside the Liberal/National Coalition that advocates for economic freedom and strengthens social conservatives (as opposed to the old right in favour of smaller economic and liberal
conservative policies with more social liberal views). [3] Unlike the United Kingdom and the United States, but like neighbouring New Zealand, the 1980s saw the Australian Labor Party begin economic reforms to the Third Way, which was familiar with the New Right ideology. After the John Howard Coalition ended 13 years of Hawke-
Keating Labor government rule at the 1996 federal election, further economic reforms have been implemented, some examples of wholesale labour market de-regulation (e.g. WorkChoices), the application of the Goods and Services Tax (GST), the exclusive Telstra privateization of telecommunications and extensive welfare reforms
including work for the dole. The H. R. Nicholls Association, an ideology that advocates for the repeal of full workplace regulations, contains a number of liberal members who are members and are considered by the New Right. [4] Economic liberalism is also known as economic reasonableism in Australia. The term economic
reasonableism was first used by Gough Whitlam of the Labour Party. [5] to describe a market-oriented social form but its meaning then evolved. It's a philosophy that tends to favor a free market economy, increase de-regulation, capitalize, lower direct taxation and higher indirect taxes, and reduce the size of the welfare state. Politicians
who supported the New Right ideology were called dry, while those who advocated the continued economic policies of the post-war consensus, typically the Keynesian economy, or more socially liberal, were called wets (the term wets were used similarly in Britain to show the Conservatives opposed to Thatcherite economic policies , but
dry in this context is much rarer in the use of English). [6] Brazil's new rights in Brazil have risen sharply in recent years in population, intellectuals and ao institutes. That was mainly due to general discontent with the previous leftist government and its policies. [7] This new movement distinguishes itself from what is known in Brazil as the
old right, which is related to the system with the Brazilian military government, the União Democrática Nacional (National Democratic Union) and IntegratedIsm. [8] It is defined by positive views on democracy, individual freedom, free market capitalism, reduced bureaucracy, the localization of state-owned companies, tax cuts,
parliamentary and political reforms. It rejects cultural Marxism, 21st Century Socialism and Populistism. [9] There have been two main phenomena related to the rise of the new Brazilian right: the Free Brazilian Movement, which gathered millions in protests against the government in March 2015; [10] and the establishment of the New
Party (Partido Novo) and Libertários, the first liberal party since the first Brazilian Republic. [11] Some of Brazil's new thinker is: Kim Kataguiri, and his movement Movimento Brasil Livre (Free Brazil Moviment), Roberto Campos,[12] Wilson Martins,[13][14] Olavo de Carvalho,[15] Luiz Felipe Pondé,[16] Paulo Francis,[17] José Guilherme
Merquior,[15] Bruno Tolentino[15] and Miguel Reale [15] As a result of this movement, in the 2018 Brazilian elections, Jair Messias Bolsonaro was elected President of Brazil with 55% of the vote, his right hand in economic topics, Paulo Guedes, a graduate of the University of Chicago, would be his Minister of Economy. Chile The term
New Right (Spanish: Nueva derecha) has gone into orthodox political speech since the sebastián Piñera elections in 2010, when interior minister Rodrigo Hinzpeter used it to describe his government. Hinzpeter's introduction to the term caused a buzz among newspapers, politicians and analysts. According to a column published in The
Clinic, the new right differs from augusto Pinochet's old dictatorship, in the sense that it embraces democracy. It is also different from the religiously conservative Unión Demócrata parties in which it is more open to discussing issues such as divorce. According to the same analysis, the new Right is becoming increasingly useful, expressed
by their decision to raise taxes after the 2010 Chilean earthquake. [18] In France, the New Right (or Nouvelle Droite) has been used as a term to describe a modern thinking of French philosophers and political intellectuals led by Alain de Benoist. Another well-known intellectual, who had been part of Alain de Benoist's GRECE, was
Guillaume Faye. Despite being accused by some critics of being far-right in their beliefs, they themselves argue that their ideas transcend the traditional left-right divide and actively encourage free debate. France also has an Identitarian New Right group (connected to the Thule Workshop in Germany); it was Terre et Peuple of Pierre Vial,
who was once an integral part and a founding member of GRECE of Alain de Benoist. [19] Germany In Germany, Neue Rechte (literally, must be new) consists of two parts: Jungkonservative (literally young conservatives), who look for followers in the civilian part of the population; and, second, Nationalrevolutionäre (national
revolutionary), who is looking for followers in the far-right part of the German population, and using the rhetoric of right-wing politicians such as Gregor and Otto Strasser. Another popular New Right group in Germany is Pierre Krebs's Thule Seminar. [19] Greece Failos Kranidiotis, a Greek politician who was expelled by new Democratic
Party president Kyriakos Mitsotakis for expressing views more similar to political rival Golden Dawn than former Greek Prime Minister Konstantinos Mitsotakis has a legacy that emulses the most important principle of the newly elected leader, include Adonis Georgiadis, who has only been a member since leaving the far-right Popular
Orthodox Rally in 2012, instead of those expressed by previous heads of the party who have close friendships with him, particularly Kostas Karamanlis, Antonis Samaras and Vangelis Meimarakis , founded the national liberal-based New Right party in May 2016. [21] Iran in Iran, the New Right and the term Modern Rights (Persian: سسار

نردم ) are related to the Executive Of the Construction Party, which has split from the word 'Traditional Right'. [22] Israel New Right is a right-wing political party in Israel, founded in 2018 and led by Ayelet Shaked and Naftali Bennett. The party aims to be a party open to both the people of the world and religion. The party supports the
preservation of a strong right wing in Israel. The New Right Netherlands (NR) was the name of a far-right/nationalist political party in the Netherlands from 2003 to 2007. The Freedom Party (PVV), founded in 2005 and led by Geert Wilders, is also a New Right movement. [23] As of March 2017, the Democratic Party is a new right-wing
party in Parliament. New Zealand In New Zealand, as in Australia, it was Labor that initially adopted the new Economic Rights Policy. Rogernomics involves monetary approaches to controlling inflation, corporatisation of government agencies, and eliminating tariffs and subsidies, while the party also pursues liberal social policies such as
decriminalisation of male homosexuality, fair pay for women and the application of a nuclear-free policy. This meant a temporary rearranged in New Zealand politics, as middle-class New Right voters voted for Labour at the 1987 New Zealand general election to approve its economic policies. At first, Labour united many former
departments of government and state assets, then simulated the Thatcher Conservative government and fully capitalized them during Labour's second term. However, the recession and the privateization together led to growing tensions within the Labour Party, which led to secescation, and the passing of Jim Anderton and his NewLabour
Party, which later formed part of the Coalition Party with the Greens and other opponents of the New Right economy. [24] However, disagreement and secessing are not limited to the Labour Party and the Coalition Party. During Labor's second term, the opposition New Zealand National Party (commonly known as 'National') selected
Ruth Richardson as opposition finance spokeswoman, and when National won the 1990 general election, Richardson became Minister of Finance, while Jenny Shipley became Minister of Social Welfare. Richardson introduced deunionisation legislation, known as the Employment Contracts Act, in 1991, while Shipley presided over social
welfare cuts, designed to reduce welfare dependence - both core New Right policy initiatives. In the early 1990s, National Party MP Winston Peters also opposed the Economic Policies of the New Right, and led his elderly voting bloc out of the National Party. As a result, his first anti-money party in New Zealand was a partner in coalition
governments led by both the National (1996-98) and The Labor Party (2005-08 and 2017-ongoing). Due to the advent of the MMP voting system, a new Consumer and Taxpayer Rights Association party, known as ACT New Zealand, was founded by former Labor's new right-wing Cabinet Ministers such as Richard Prebble and others,
and maintained existing New Right policy initiatives such as the Employment Contracts Act , and introduced American-style welfare reform. ACT New Zealand aspires to be National's centre-right coalition partner, but has been hampered by a lack of party unity and populist leadership that often lacks strategic direction. For Labour and
their country, their fortunes have been mixed. Labour was out of office for most of the Nineties, only to regain power Helen Clark leads it to victory and a Labor/Coalition and the center-left government (1999-2002). However, the Alliance disbanded in 2002. National was defeated in 1999 due to the absence of a suitable stable coalition
partner, as New Zealand First disbanded in part after Winston Peters abandoned the previous Nationally led coalition. When Bill English became national leader in 2001, it was thought he could lead the party away from its previously tough New Right economic and social policies, but his inegnoscence and lack of solid policy direction led
to ACT New Zealand winning the New Right middle-class voting base in 2002. When Don Brash became leader, new right middle-class voters returned to National's position, sparking National's revival in fortunes at the 2005 New Zealand general election. At the same time, however, ACT New Zealand strongly criticized it for deviating
from its previous New Right economic policy views, and at the same election, National did little to allow the survival of the ACT. Don Brash resigned as leader of the National Party, replaced by John Key. , a more moderate national mp. For the centre-left, Helen Clark and her Labor-led coalition have been criticised by former Coalition
members and NGOs for their alleged lack of attention to centre-left social policies, while trade union membership recovered as Labor repealed the 1991 Labour Contracts Act and abolished labour market regulations and employment repeal that accompanied it in the 90s. It is reasonable that Clark and her Cabinet were influenced by Tony
Blair and his British Labour Government, pursuing a similar balancing act between social and fiscal responsibility while in government. [25] Poland in Poland, a conservative liberal party[26][27][28][28][29] and the Eurosceptic Political Party Congress of the New Right were formed on 25 March 2011 from the former Liberal and Legitimate
Political Parties (WiP) and the Real Political Alliance (UPR) by Janusz Korwin-Mikke. It is supported by different voters, some conservatives who want to legalize marijuana and citizens who validate free markets and capitalism. South Korea In South Korea, South Korea's new right-wing movement is an attempt by North Korea in new
conservative politics. Lee Myung-bak's government was led by President Lee Myung-bak and the Conservative National Party was noted as a benefactor of the domestic Xinyi movement. [30] The main article of the United Kingdom: Thatcherism In the United Kingdom, the term New Right specifically refers to a strand of Conservativeism
that the like of Margaret Thatcher and Ronald Reagan influenced. Thatcher's New Right ideology, known as Thatcherism, was heavily influenced by the work of Friedrich Hayek (especially the book The Road to Serfdom). They have been anthoctively committed to economic liberalism as well as Social. Key policies include: de-de-
regulation of dismantling the welfare state, prising state industries and restructuring the national workforce to increase industrial and economic flexibility in an increasingly global market. [31] The United States This article is part of a series of articles on Concubism in the American Schools Compassion Fiscal Fusion National Freedom
Movement Neo Paleo Traditional Principles Of American SocialIsm SpecialIsm Classic Liberal Family Value Free Market Free Trade Judeo-Christian Values Limits The Government's Moral Absolutism Law However Protectionism Republicans Rule of law Traditional Bourbon Conservative Democratic Union Conservative Democratic Party
Conservative Manifesto New Modern City Right Old Right Overview Rockefeller Republican Southern Peasant Who Abrams Adelson Agnew Ailes Alito Anton Armey Ashcroft Atwater Bachmann Baker Bakker (Jim) Bannon Barr Beck Benson Bolton Bond Bork Bozell Jr. Bradford Jr. Burger Burnham H. W. Bush W. Bush Carlson
Chambers Cheney Cleveland Coburn Colson Coolidge Coulter Cruz DeLay DeMint Derbyshire Dirksen Dolan Dole D'Souza Duggar Dulles (Allen) Dulles (John Foster) Eastland Eisenhower Erickson Falwell Falwell Jr. Feulner Fleming Forbes Ford Francis Friedman Frum Gingrich Gottfried Goldberg Goldwater Gorsuch Goss Graham
Grant Hagee Haig Hannity Hastert Hatch Harding Helms Hoppe Horowitz Huckabee Hunt Jaffa Jeffress Jones Jordan Kasich Kavanaugh Kemp Keyes King Kirk Kirkpatrick Kissinger Knowland Koch (Charles) Koch Krauthammer Kristol Laffer LeMay Leo Levin Limbaugh Lindbergh Lodge Lott Luce Mason McCain McCarthy McCloy
McConnell McCurtain McFarlane McFarlane McKinley Meese Meyer Miller Mises Nixon North Novak Oliver O'Reilly Osborne Palin Paul (Rand) Paul (Ron) Peale Pence Perot Phillips Podhoretz Rand Reagan Roberts (John) Santorum Savage Scalia Schiff Schlafly Schlesinger Sessions Shapiro Shultz Skousen Smith Sobran Sowell
Stevens Stockman Stoddard Strauss Stone Taft (Robert A.) Taft (William Howard) Thomas Thompson Trump Tyrrell Vandenberg Viguerie Volpe Wayne Weaver Weinberger Welch Jr. Weyrich Will Williams Wolfowitz Parties American Party American Independent Party (modern) Conservative Party of New York State Constitution Party
Democratic Party (early factions) Democratic-Republican Party (elements) Federalist Party Libertarian Party Native American Party Prohibition Party Reform Party Republican Party Think tanks Acton Institute Alexis de Tocqueville Institution American Enterprise Institute Center for Immigration Studies Center for Security Policy Center for
the National Interest Charles Koch Claremont Institute for Corporate Competition Institute David Horowitz Freedom Discovery Center Institute ethics and public policy Center for Family Studies Gatestone Institute Viện Heartland Quỹ Di sản Hoover Viện Hudson Viện Nghiên cứu Intercollegiate Viện trên Hiến pháp Manhattan Viện Mises
Viện Nghiên cứu Thái Bình Dương Dự án cho New American Century Ripon Society R Street Viện Rockford Viện Nhà nước Chính sách Mạng Lưới Thuế Foundation Các tổ chức khác ACT! for America Alliance Defending Freedom American Center for Law &amp; Justice American Family Association American Liberty League Americans
for Tax Reform Arlington Group Chalcedon Foundation Christian Coalition of America Christian Voice Club for Growth Concerned Women for America ConservAmerica The Conservative Caucus Council of Conservative Citizens Council for National Policy Eagle Forum Faith and Freedom Coalition Family Research Council Federalist
Society Federation for American Immigration Reform The Fellowship Focus on the Family Foundation for Individual Rights in Education Foundation for Moral Law Freedom Caucus Freedom Partners FreedomWorks Gun Owners of America Independent Women's Forum John Birch Society John M. Olin Foundation Judicial Watch
Leadership Institute Liberty Counsel Liberty Lobby Log Cabin Republicans Media Research Center Moral Majority National Conservative PAC National Federation of Independent Business National Organization for Marriage National Rifle Association National Right to Life Committee National Taxpayers Union NumbersUSA Oath Keepers
Pacific Justice Institute Philadelphia Society Regnery Publishing Republican Main Street Partnership Republican Study Committee Second Amendment Caucus Susan B. Anthony List Tea Party Patriots Thomas More Law Center Turning Point USA Traditional Values Coalition United States Chamber of Commerce Young America's
Foundation Young Americans for Liberty Youth for Western Civilization Media American Affairs The American Conservative The American Spectator American Renaissance American Thinker Big League Politics Blaze Media Breitbart News Campus Reform Chicago Tribune CBN City Journal Claremont Review of Books CNSNews.com
Commentary Conservative Review Chronicles Daily Caller Daily Signal Daily Wire Dallas Morning News Drudge Report The Federalist First Things Fox Business Fox News FrontPage Magazine Front Porch Republic Gateway Pundit Hot Air Human Events i24 News Independent Journal Review InfoWars Jewish World Review Jihad
Watch Las Vegas Review-Journal LifeSiteNews LifeZette Modern Age Các vấn đề quốc gia The National Interest National Review The New American The New Criterion NewsBusters Newsmax New York Observer New York Post One America News Network PanAm Post Policy Review Power Line PragerU PJ Media Rare Real News
Update RedState RSBN Sinclair Broadcast Group Spectator USA The Spotlight Taki's Magazine Townhall TruthRevolt Twitchy VDARE The Wall Street Journal Washington Examiner The Washington Free Beacon The Washington Times The Standard The Western Journal WorldNetDaily Variations and Movements Asia and the Pacific
Islander Conservative Black Conservative Christian Rights Conservative Women's Conservative Green Conservative LGBT Conservatives Liberal Republican Patriot Movement Radical Right-libertarianism Tea Party See Also Media Alternative American Bibliography Liberal List of Prominent Political Parties Conservative portalvte Part of
a series onLibertarianism in theUnited States Origins Age of Enlightenment Classical liberalism Individualist anarchism in the United States Concepts Anti-imperialism Argumentation ethics Civil libertarianism Counter-economics Decentralization Departurism Economic free market Free market Free movement Free trade free trade will
Free Association freedom of contract Homestead Principles Liberal Freedom Government Limited Local Government Natural privateized marriage and legal right Principles non-aggression Non-interference Non-political Non-voting Law multi-minded Public asset protection agency chooses the theory of restoring justice Self-possession tax
single government small order Liberal social non-citizenship Resistance War Tax Title Shifts TheOry of Contracts Voluntary Society Voluntary Austrian Free Schools-Free Bleeding-heart liberal Christian Liberalism Liberalism Consequences Of Liberal Liberalism Green Liberalism Neoliberalism Liberalism Technolibertarianism Theory
Agorism Anarcho-Capitalism Autarchism Constitutionalism Fusionism Libertarian feminism Left-wing market anarchism Libertarian conservatism Libertarian paternalism Minarchism Libertarianism Panarchism Propertarianism Laissez-faire Neoliberalism Supply-side economics People Amash Barnett Block Brennan Caplan Carson Chartier
Chodorov Epstein Friedman Gillespie Goldwater Hazlitt Heinlein Hess Hoppe Hospers Huemer Johnson Jorgensen Kinsella Konkin III Long Machan McElroy Mencken Napolitano Nock Nolan Nozick Paterson Paul Postrel Read Rock Rothwellbard Schu Stossel Thiel Thoreau Tucker Wilder Lane Williams Woods New History Left Old Right
Abortion Issue Death Penalty photo Foreign Criticism Immigration Inheritance Intellectual Property Debate Internal LGBT Rights Objectivism Political Party State Theory of Law Liberal Science Fiction Organization Coalition of Freedom Left Cato Institute Free State Project Foundation for Economic Education International Alliance of
Libertarian Parties Libertarian Party Liberty Fund Liberty International Mises Institute Reason Foundation Students for a Democratic for Liberty Works Anarchy, State, and Utopia Ethics of Liberty For a New Liberty: Liberal Manifesto to Select Laws, Laws and Liberty Markets for Liberty Topics Related Conservatives in U.S. Left-
Libertarianism Liberalism in the United States Liberal Democrats Liberal Republicans in Hong Kong Liberal Liberalism in South Africa Liberalism in the United Kingdom Right Outline of Liberalism : Conservatives in the United States See Also: New Conservativeism Should Not Be Confused with Alt-lite. In the United States, the New Right
refers to two historically distinct conservative political movements. [32]:624–25 These New Rights of the United States differ and are in contrast to the more moderate tradition of the so-called Rockefeller Republic. The New Right is also different from the Old Right (1933-1955) on foreign policy issues with new conservatives opposed to old
right-wing non-interventionism. [32]:625 First New Right The First New Right (1955–64) focuses on right-wing liberals, traditionalism, and anti-communists at William F. Buckley's National Review. [32]:624 Sociologies and journalists have been using the new right since the 1950s; it was first used as self-identification in 1962 by student
activist group Young Americans for Freedom. [33] The new right first embraced what it called unityism (a superficial synthesizer of classical liberal economics, traditional and anti-communist social values)[32]:338-41 and was associated in the years before Barry Goldwater's 1964 presidential campaign. The Goldwater campaign, which
failed to oust incumbent President Lyndon B. Johnson, has accelerated the formation of a new political movement. First new rights figures: William F. Buckley, Jr. - editor of national review Frank Meyer - anti-communist liberal and author of fusionist political theory James Burnham - anti-communist political theo theory M. Stanton Evans -
journalist and writer of young Americans for Freedom Sharon Claims Barry Goldwater - U.S. Senator from Arizona and Republican presidential candidate U.S. Second New Right The second new right (1964 to date) was founded in the wake of the New Goldwater Rights. The second new right tends to focus on wedge issues (such as
abortion) and is often associated with Religious Rights. [34] The second new right formed a policy approach and the electoral system that brought Ronald Reagan into the White House in the 1980 presidential election. The new right was held at the American Enterprise Institute and Heritage Foundation to fight the so-called liberal
establishment. In elite think tanks and local community organizations, new policies, marketing strategies and strategies were crafted in the following decades to promote strong conservative policies. [35] Second new rights character: Ronald Reagan – 40th president of the United States, actor, 33rd governor of California, union leader
George H. W. Bush - 41st President of the United States, U.S. Ambassador to the United Nations, Director of Central Intelligence, Businessman, Humanitarian George W. Bush - 43rd President of the United States Newt Gingrich - Former Congressman , Speaker of the House of Representatives, U.S. presidential candidate, author Rush
Limbaugh - national talk radio host and former cable news presenter, author Milton Friedman - neoclassical economist of the Chicago School of Economics, recipient of the 1976 Nobel Prize in Economics Richard Viguerie - direct mail activist Howard Phillips - founder of The Conservative Caucus Robert Grant - activist Christian Voice
rights activist and Christian Voice founder Terry Dolan - National Conservative Political Action Committee founder Jerry Falwell - Southern Baptist Minister, Liberty University founder and Ethics Majority Phyllis Schlafly - anti-feminist activist and Eagle Forum founder Paul Weyrich - founder of the Heritage Foundation and Free Congress
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