
Channel 9 tv guide qld

 

Continue

https://gettraff.ru/123?keyword=channel+9+tv+guide+qld


Thorium Mod significantly expands the number of options available for four vanilla classes - Melee, Ranged, Magic and Summon. In addition to this, mod adds a completely revamped Thrower class with mechanics unique to Thorium Mod, as well as two brand new classes for the player to play as: Healer
and Bard. As with vanilla, the versatility, capabilities and power of each class increase as the game progresses. This, as well as the existing selection of vanilla, means it can be overwhelming for the first time a player to decide what to use. This guide will provide potential weapons, armor, accessories and
other options for each class at multiple points of the game. Please note that this guide will only apply to Thorium equipment. For a list of Terraria vanilla equipment, please refer to this guide. For more detailed guidance for the Healer class, please refer to this guide. If you want, use bombs to immediately
access Shadow Orbs/Crimson Hearts and Meteors. Take on an army of goblins or explore the jungle if you are willing to face a lot of danger. Bosses in this section of Grand Thunder Bird, King Slim, and Cthulhu's Eye. Pre-Skeletron (edited source editing) This section assumes that the player has visited
all relevant bios, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions before Skeletron. Preliminary Wall of Flesh (edited by editing source) This section assumes that the player has visited all relevant bios, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions in front of the Wall of Flesh. Pre-mechanical bosses edit
the source This section assumes that the player has visited all relevant biomes, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions to Gemini, Destroyer, and Skeletron Prime. Pre-Plantera (edited by the source of editing) This section assumes that the player has visited all the relevant bios, and defeated all
previous bosses and intrusions before Plantera. Pre-Golem (edited by the source of editing) This section assumes that the player has visited all the relevant bios, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions to Golem. Pre-Editing Events (edited by editing source) This section assumes that the player
has visited all relevant bios, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions to The Heavenly Pillars. Pre-Primordials (edit source) This section assumes that the player has visited all relevant biomes, and defeated all previous bosses and intrusions to the original. Endgame edit source This section
assumes that the player has visited all relevant bios, and defeated all the bosses and intrusions provided by Vanilla and Thorium Mod. From Thorium Mod Wiki, don't be confused with Boss/Event by calling items. Various items related to the call have been added, increase the variety of call-up sources of
damage, and expand the Summoner class in Terraria significantly. 11 new accessories and 6 types of armor armor have been added in addition to summoner's arsenal and new subcategory of elements, Summoner Banners, provide a boon for the player or their henchmen or sentries in the immediate
vicinity. There are currently 12 Pre-Hardmode and 20 Hardmode henchmen, 21 hour-long subpoenas, 5 other weapons that are causing damage, and 7 banner appeals. Weapons (edited editing source) Minions (edit source editing) Sentries (edit source editing) Other weapons that cause damage (edit the
source of editing) Summoner Banners (edit source) Summoner Banners are to use tools that provide buffs for the player while they are in close proximity to the banner (indicated around the banner), providing bonuses to the player or their henchmen. Only one banner of call can be active at the same time.
Item Banner Buff Effect (s) Purchased/Made from up to Hardmode Falconeer's Cane Falcon Familiar Falcon Minion attacks have a 1/3 chance to inflict an additional 10% damage, Created: 18 ( ) Hive Mind Hive Mind Mind MiniOn Attacks have a 1/4 chance to confuse enemies within 1.5 seconds of falling
on an army ant (5% or 1/20 chance) Hardmode sacrificial dagger sacrificial dagger sacrificial effigy Enemies killed sacrifice minion in a short period of time, to attack enemies purchased from Confused zombie Battle Banner Battle Banner Battle Banner Mignon Damage increased by 5 Crafted: 18 (or )
Combative Banner Damage Reduction increased by 3% for maximum minion Manufactured: 18 x 10 x 2 x 2 ( ) Moral Banner Banner Banner Minyon Attacks have 1/5 chance to heal the player for 1 life Crafted : 18 - 10 - 2 - 2 ( ) Power Banner Banner Nearest watch player inflicts 50% increased damage
Manufactured: 18 - 10 - 2 - 2 ( ) Call th / ) Call to the statistical complements Edit Source Armor (edited source editing) Appearance/Name Mignon Boost (s) Purchased/Made from Pre-Hardmode Living Wood Armor 2 Cause Damage 1 mignon rollback Set Bonus: 1 maximum henchmen, Live wooden
saplings attack will be home to enemies Crafted: 24 and 45 ( ) Astro Armor No. 2 cause damage No. 1 maximum henchmen No. 1 maximum watch Set Bonus: Minion damage has a chance to unleash an explosion of plasma damage on the hit Crafted : 45 (q /) Spirit Trapper Armor 15% Minion Damage
No. 2 Maximum Henchmen (Trapper Spirit Helmet) or No. 2 Maximum Watch (Trapper Spirit Mask) Set Bonus: Killing Enemies Generates Soul Shreds , after generating 5 shreds, you will be healed 10 life Crafted: 36 and 15 ( ) Hardmode Life Bloom Armor No. 3 maximum henchmen 25% mignon damage
No 1 mignon rollback Set Bonus: Minion attacks have a 33% chance to heal you lightly crafted: 30 and 6 (q / ) Mask Magma In 6 maximum henchmen No. 3 maximum watchmaking 50% mignon damage No. 2 mignon rollback Set Bonus: All minion damage leaves a lingering burn that causes significant
damage over time Crafted: 3 ( ) ) | Edit Source Appearance / Name Mignon Boost (s) Purchased / Made from Amber Ring Manufactured: Swarm of Spiders, Derived from the cobwebs-covered Corpse or Dropped by Wall Creeper (8.33% or 1/12 chance) Necromancer's Heart No. 1 Maximum Hour Reduces
Life Regeneration by 20% Bought from Confused zombie Soul Stone 10% Minion Damage Reduces Maximum Life expectancy by 20 Crafted: No 5 (q /) Prehistoric Attack Arachnid Minion Have 10% Chance to produce Amber Spider Minion Attacks Deal 2 More Damage while Amber Spider Active Crafted:
-Minion Damage by 10% Fell on Raging Minotaur (25% or 1/ 4 chance) Phylactery No 1 Maximum Henchmen No. 1 Maximum Sentries 10% M mind damage Taking deadly damage instead will return you 20 lives every five minutes Crafted : ( . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Подвеска No 1 максимальные приспешники 10% миньона ущерб Summons атакующий дух при повреждении Созданный: 8 (или ) 10 ( ) Баффс (редактировать источник) Бафф Пункт Эффект (ы) Артиллерия Артиллерийское зелье из Ториум Мод Вики &lt; Ториум Мод
Вики: Проекты Кожаный хлыст: 14 Вызов ущербаПервый из кнута семьи, Кожаная хлыст продается после завершения 15% Бестиари. Это основной кнут с не так много специальных эффектов, кроме способности ориентации и тегов повреждения аддон, что все кнуты доля. Несмотря на
это, оружие такого диапазона, особенно если заработал достаточно рано, может оказаться особенно полезным. Те, кто играет чистый Summoner может оценить это. Но если вы заполнили 15% Bestiary, вы, вероятно, способны получить следующий кнут в прогрессии. Snapthorn: 18
Challenge damageThe Snapthorn created on the anvil using 12 Stingers, 3 Vines, and 3 Jungle Spores. It's the only other whip available in Pre-Hardmode, but it definitely pulls its weight when used correctly. Among other whip features, Snapthorn also inflicts poisoned on its targets; In addition, each strike
briefly increases the speed of the melee attack, allowing the subsequent use of these weapons to hit faster. This whip is particularly good at focusing down one goal with a high HP, despite the possibility of AoE. The queen of Medusa is a Pre-Hardmode boss available in Therium Mod, caused by the help of



Medusa Resonator in the ocean during the day. Boss Royal jelly throughout the fight, making it difficult to fight without proper training. Below are some tips, tips and strategies to help defeat it. Terrain Preparation (edited by editing) While it is possible to defeat the queen over open waters with water potion
or water walking boots, it is recommended to create an arena to fight for. One possible option would be to line up about 120 platforms, with a vertical tower of either platforms or Minecart tracks - about 20-30 blocks high - every 30 blocks; These towers will serve as catchment pools for your Grappling Hook
to provide a quick escape from some boss attacks. The arena can also include bonfires, heart lanterns, star bottles, and sunflowers to give the player an increase in life regeneration, mana regeneration, and speed of motion for the encounter. If you are using a weapon that uses a projectile that bounces off
blocks such as Yew Wood Lute or Water Bolt, you can line up an area above the arena with solid blocks to allow such projectiles to bounce back into battle, increasing your exit damage. At this point in the game, each class has a special set of armor that provides bonuses for a certain type of damage.
However, if you use different types of weapons of different types, there are some other kits that you should consider. Thorium armor is a strong choice, offering a 10% increase in damage to all types of weapons. Steel armor is easy to purchase, and its increased damage reduction helps if you find yourself
unable to dodge many attacks from a meeting. Crimson armor, similarly, greatly increases the life of the player generation. Flight armor is a fantastic choice in terms of agility, as its bonus set provides the player with a set of Wings. Finally, if you're playing with a band, The Depth Diver armor provides buffs
to all players nearby, making it worthy of attention. If you play as a warrior, Shadow Armor is a good choice, especially if you use Yoyo, as the increase in melee speed translates to an increase in the yoyo range, allowing you to attack the queen from a safer distance. If you are at peace with Crimson
instead of Corruption, you should aim for the magma armor created from Magma Bars. It doesn't increase your melee speed, which makes it more risky compared to shadow armor, but its set is a bonus to improve the effectiveness of On Fire! and Singed makes it a more offensive counterpart. If you play
as a ranger, Yew Wood armor and Tide Hunter armor kits are the only Rangers-specific armor available at the moment. Although the Tide Hunter armor was purchased later in the depths, Yew Wood's armor is a little more For combat; its increased shooting speed and mini-crits allows him to deal more
more over time compared to tide hunter armor. Tide Hunter armor, on the other hand, has a little more defense and a critical kick chance, and its bonus set allows you to slow down and easier to deal with Royal Jellies. If you play as a magician, you should aim for either jungle, bulb armor, or - if you
manage to complete the necessary contracts - Malignant Armor. Malignant armor in particular does not require leggings to get a bonus set, allowing you to use any other armor leggings. Jungle Pants provide the best magical bonuses at the moment of the game. If you want to use Space Gun for this fight,
be sure to equip Meteor Armor for your bonus set. If you play as a Summoner, the best armor set available is Astro Armor. This armor is particularly good against the jellyfish queen as its bonus set gives henchmen the chance to create a burst of plasma on a hit that is fantastic at cutting down a flock of
royal jelly. If you play as a thrower, while the boss is quite possible with sandstone armor, you should use fossils, or at least ninja armor, as it provides a wide range of throwing boosts. If you play as a healer, the strongest armor set that is available at the moment is rainbow armor if you have not defeated
Skeletron. If you're playing as a bard, if you haven't explored the Underworld, the strongest armor available is Jester Armor. Its set bonus, though not affecting the queen herself, makes it slower for royal jelly, making them easier to deal with. The Spectre Boots source editing and editing accessories, along
with its Lightning Boots and Frostspark Boots updates, are a fantastic accessory to improve your dodging capabilities to combat, allowing you to increase horizontal and vertical movement. Other options include Mana-Charged Rocketeers, Traveler Boots, or Survivalist's Boots. If you have a spare
accessory slot, Mana-Charged Rocketeers provide an almost endless flight for players not using mana. One of the attacks from the queen launches the player high into the sky, so accessories that reduce the damage done from the fall may be worth considering if you have a hard time recovering from it.
While Lucky Horseshoe and her potential upgrades offers full damage cancellations from the fall, if you don't have another option include Spring Steps, Frog Leg, or Cloud in a Bottle. The simplest solution, however, is to simply use the Spectre Boots flight or fight on the platform. The Ring accessory is
useful for several of the buffs it offers. At this point you should be able to work out a ring that combines each one, making it a pretty powerful choice. Crietz is able to grind quickly given the number of critical blows. If you play expert mode, the dash from the Cthulhu shield is quite useful for the fight. Side
Side Allowing the player to quickly dodge the boss while turning around, it's also useful for removing any Royal Jelly on your way. In addition, the Worm Scarf offers damage reduction, which can be helpful to take some extra hits throughout the meeting. Melee players must equip Yoyo String, as the
increased range will significantly reduce the danger you will be in close proximity to the boss, as well as helping to remove The Royal Jellies. The counterweight is very useful for yoyo users as well. Feral Claws are worth considering, but only if you use a sword (not recommended if it doesn't have a
projectile). Throwers have different options to use. A guide for Expert Throwing offers a decent increase in your throwing damage, but can be replaced by either Bone Grip or Spartan sandals, as they offer more throwing benefits. Bards, similarly, have a wide range of options to consider for a fight.
Mouthpiece allows for your wind instruments to get home on enemies; While later in the fight it is actually harmful because of his attempt to attack the Royal Jelly rather than the boss himself, it is perfectly used in the first half, where there are fewer minions aroused, and can inflict a large amount of damage
when switching directions when he is running in several homing projectiles. Plunger Mute suffers from a lack of good weapons at this stage of the game, but if you have a hot horn, spreading sparks is useful for cleaning away flocks of royal jelly. Guitar Pick is of little use in the large open area required for
this fight, and a vibration tuner is not available unless you have defeated Skeletron. Mix Tape provides a decent Singed debuff that helps damage when you regenerate your inspiration; Marching boots or updating it can help with that. Other options for the fight include high quality cane, Pad O'Paper, or
music notes. The weapon edit the source In general, piercing weapons are excellent under the excited fight, due to the sheer number of Royal Jelly boss calls throughout the fight. Melee edit the source Many melee weapons are impractical against the jellyfish queen, because of the far nature of the battle.
Despite this, there are several other options. Swords should be limited in sidearm to fight, as its swing arc makes them excellent for clearing off any royal jelly on your way. Phaseblade or Blade of Grass are preferred for this purpose. The flowering blade is especially great for this encounter, as it has long
coverage, fast swing speed, and provides more growth positive effect on the hit, giving the player a slight increase to various statistics. Swords should only be seen to fight the queen of jellyfish If it is capable of firing a projectile. The best option for this is Starfury; The star that is falling from it is capable of
piercing up to 2 enemies, making it useful to defeat the spitting jellyfish that hover over the boss as well as the queen herself. In addition, it does a lot of damage, and the swing from the sword still causes damage, which allows both the boss and any royal jelly trying to ram you. Bellerose and Enchanted
Sword are also both good choices for a more direct beam firing weapon, although the former requires Obsidian and therefore requires a Nightmare/Deathbringer Pickaxe or Reaver Shark. Spears is not recommended for the fight. They are just too slow to effectively fight numerous royal jelly, and not long
enough to fight the boss themselves without putting themselves in danger. Even with the spear board equipped, they do not cause enough damage. Because of the number of royal jellys designed to protect the queen, boomerangs are not particularly useful for the boss himself. However, it is still
recommended to use one as an armpit to throw whenever the opportunity presents itself, whether it is a thin number of royal jelly or inflict additional damage against the boss himself. Danger Doomerang allows you to throw 2 boomerangs at once, the Magmatic Reflector applies to the Singed Debuff, and
the petal flower provides a more growth positive effect on the kick. Because of their piercing properties, Thrown Flails is not a terrible choice, however, if you decide to use one, you need to place solid blocks below your floor platform, otherwise they will go through and take significantly longer to remember
the head waving. The main options for this point of the game are Ball O' Hurt or meatballs (depending on if the evil of your world is Corruption or Crimson), and Magma Flail. Yoyos are the best option for melee users against the jellyfish queen. With some items to increase their range, you can comfortably
inflict a large amount of damage against the boss without putting yourself in serious harm, and ricochet the iojo head often endure any nearby royal jelly, such as those immediately spawned. Their only inconvenience is dealing with Royal Jellies who were able to avoid your attack while trying to ram in you;
for wearing a sword or boomerang for them recommended. Malaise, Artery, Illustrious, and Air are all excellent options. Air is a particularly good option, as it causes eight feathered projectiles in eight cardinal directions from time to time, doing much more damage than a non-rocket ioyo. If the Viscount was
defeated before the battle, the Bat Wing is a big oyo because of its long range and homing bats shells, but the lack of projectiles in general makes it more difficult to use. Ranged 'edit (source editing) Ranged weapons are a great choice for this fight, as many of the weapons and have long range and
piercing capabilities. For The For Some options include Yew Wood Bow and Pen Foe. Talon Burst, dumped by Grand Thunder Bird, is a worthy option with armor penetration, for example, from a shark tooth, as its storm bolts allow you to hit the enemy twice. However, it does not puncture its effectiveness
in the later stages of the battle. Danger Double Shot shoots 2 arrows at once, making it powerful at clearing a flock of royal jelly when paired with an arrow that pierces. Thus, the main choice of arrow should be between the Arrows of the Ocean and the Arrows of the Joke because of their ability to pierce.
Ocean Arrows have a chance to inflict the powerful Debaff Gouge, which has the added benefit of ignoring the reduction of damage to the queen during its cyclone attack, while the Jester arrows are not exposed to gravity and have no limit to the number of enemies they can punch through. Weapons are
also viable options. Yew-Handled Flintlock is easy to obtain and has high shooting speed and good damage. Either Minishark or Shark Storm are good options because of their high DPS and automatic shooting properties. At this point, the only bullet with the ability to pierce enemies is Meteor Shot. Since
they can also bounce off the blocks, it's a good idea to surround your arena with blocks to take advantage of this. Like Minishark, the Aqua Pelter has a high rate of fire, automatic fire, and no ammunition to fire. However, it doesn't pierce, making it only fantastic for the opening stages of the battle. Although
Webgun can't punch, its projectile creates a harmful area of web impact. If you manage to constantly hit the queen of jellyfish, the royal jelly spawned over it will often be immediately removed from the internet. If you can't find one, Spud Bomber is more easily obtained an option that still does decent
damage. Finally, zapper isn't particularly useful against the boss because of his sub-par DPS, but his instant transmission and piercing makes him excel in collecting from any royal jelly, especially spitting jelly. Magic (edit source editing) As with the range of weapons, Magic is a good option as well. Many
of their weapons have a large range and some degree of piercing, but have more room to cover a large area in exchange for having to cope with mana. This is not a serious problem, however, as many mana-recovery stars will fall out of the Royal Jelly. Magick staff, though weak in terms of damage, has
several properties, making it an excellent weapon to use, boasting piercings, a few debuffs such as on fire! and Iheor, and life to steal. The Thorium headquarters does not pierce, but the damage will shoot 4 additional self-guided projectiles that will go either to many Royal Jelly or himself The crimson rod
is great as a side weapon to use once in a while, damaging the area; You can cause a cloud over the boss when he makes his cyclone attack for Damage. His colleague, Vilethorn, is not as helpful, but his piercing makes it good for cleaning away royal jelly. Shadowflame staff are recommended as it
pierces all enemies and strikes Shadowflame. His slow speed, however, means that some practice will be needed to bring shots to the boss. Finally, the Petal Stick is a phenomenal weapon in terms of DPS thanks to its high damage, shooting speed, auto-fire, and over-growth positive effect. It doesn't
pierce, but even at later points, when a huge amount of royal jelly makes it hard to hit the queen, the positive effect will increase the damage from any weapon used, meaning that it's still good to shoot once in a while to maintain a positive effect for other piercing weapons. Another shrill weapon is the Wind
Gust, sold by Acolyte Desert, being cheap to buy and reforge, and having larger than the average size hit boxes. Water Bolt, if you find it at the top of the dungeon, is similar, but does a little more damage and can ricochet off the blocks. The Dark Tom of the Dark Magician's Treasure Bag is costly to use
mana, but just like a petal stick, is powerful enough to derail the health of the jellyfish queen. Magic finish is very useful if you venture to the depths before you fight the boss, but it can prove difficult to get. The space cannon, especially if you use Meteor armor, is a very durable weapon, with high shot
speed, auto-use, and small piercing properties. It's quite expensive in terms of using mana without Meteor armor, so if you use it without a armor set, try to beat as many Royal Jelly as you can to keep a solid amount of mana-recovery stars nearby. Finally, Charchaner's sword is still useful as an armpit to
remove any royal jelly, thanks to its arc, decent size, and lack of mana value. This additionally provides the Enchanted Buff, further enhancing the player's magical offensive abilities on the kick. Summoner edit the source Like most henchmen inherently pierce enemies, the call of arms is fantastic against
the queen of jellyfish. For meeting, henchmen capable of flying are preferred, due to the floating nature of both the boss and his caviar. A good option for this is the Meteor Chief of Staff. Acorn from a living tree is not very useful, as its damage to the south of the par and can not pierce. Even so, there is no
reason not to use it, as it is not worth the minion slot and can provide little support. It is highly recommended to clear the first tier of the Old Army before fighting the queen of Medusa, as this allows the player to use the recordings outside the event. Of the 4 options available, the Ballista Rod is the strongest
choice, boasting high damage and piercing. Although slowly reboot, it shoots as soon as it is called, meaning a quick re-call of Ballista, you can significantly increase the damage output. Flame not a terrible choice, but, compared to Ballista, lacks vertical aiming, damage and piercing. His burst of damage
makes him potentially useful against royal jelly, however. Explosive trap and lightning Aura Rhea can be used to clean flocks of spitting jelly, but if you want to do so, you have to expand the width of the vertical arena towers to make it easier to place the clock on them. If you don't find a tavern, there's
another way to use sentries without a Tavern. The creeping personnel vine is an excellent choice for this fight because of its ability to attack enemies within the hour range, making it very useful to fight. If your world is in Crimson, Bleeding Heart Staff is a good choice as it will double the speed limit when
enemies have damaged it clock by five or more. If your world is in corruption, The Staff Eater is an excellent choice as he cracks an egg in 4 tiny eaters who are home to enemies, making it very useful against his boss and jellyfish. Throwing editing source Because of the number of henchmen, the best
choice for throwing weapons should be some variety of knives because of their piercing. Of these, the best choices to date are Aquaite Knives; They possess a phenomenal DPS, can automatically fire, and their ricochet allows them to either defeat the nearby Royal Jelly or nail extra hits against the queen.
If you don't want to venture into the water depths until after the boss fight, Frost daggerfish or bone-throwing knives are alternatives that are still solid. If you've cleared all royal jellies and have a clean shot towards the boss himself, Javelin might be better suited to his best single-goal damage. Goblin Wars
Spears has a chance to inflict a powerful Gouge debuff, shaving a large amount of health, even when the queen of medusa reduced damage climbs during his cyclone attack. The Javelins bone is even better at this; Individual weapons do higher damage, and while the cut-through debuff is not as strong as
Gouge, it is more consistent to inflict and lasts for a longer period of time, making it a total DPS higher. Explosives offer a very real opportunity to blow yourself into splash damage, especially given the amount of jealous and distracting jelly trying to intercept you, but in the hands of skilled and confident
players, large tracts caused by jelly can be easily cleared and extreme amounts of damage can be inflicted on the queen herself. The higher natural speed of Bouncy Grenades makes them the easiest to land against the boss. Happy grenades are the safest explosives, but they are difficult to obtain initially,
requiring the murder of a girl party member. Sticky grenades can be stuck Vertical tower platforms, making it easier to manipulate the boss to float right into them. The last two options to consider Sea Ninja Stars and Molotov cocktails. Despite not being able to punch, Sea Ninja-Stars have automatic fire,
high speed and throw speed, adequate DPS, and are relatively easy to accumulate, making them an economic option. Molotov cocktails, on the other hand, are hard to get but fantastic against the boss. They have high damage, strike on fire!, have an acceptable speed, and unlike standard grenades, do
not risk damaging the thrower. Healers must, as their name argues, give the highest priority in restoring the health of their allies or supporting them in various capacity. Of the healing spells available, some good options include Good Book, Pain Eater or Brain Coral, Cleansing Water Bag, Tulip Staff, and, if
you play expert mode, Dark Gift. At this stage of the game, your ability to support spells is severely limited. There are only two options readily available: Cure, created with a book, peeled shards, bottled water, and Stinger; and a military forger bought from a blacksmith. As the queen of jellyfish does not
inflict any debuffs that can be removed from the Cure, the war forger should be your only option. Fortunately, this is a pretty decent option as the player can leave a magic anvil near the center of the arena, and quickly activate it whenever they pass through some free lifes shield. As for the shining
weapons, you should basically focus on those with range, given the nature of the fight. Therefore, braids should not be used for any reason other than to help clarify the Royal Jelly. To do this, enough dark braid, crimson braid or Scythian Aquaita. The exception to this rule is a poisonous thorn; With its
right-click ability to cause poisonous clouds and automatic fire, it can provide a risky but feasible way to defeat the queen of jellyfish. Leach Bolt is a fantastic weapon because his range, piecing, and life steal allow for extra survivability to better support his allies or fight the boss. Shadow wand is also good
once you are used to its awkward trajectory and can reliably hit the boss. If you have, you have a weapon that has automatic fire and piercing properties as well as decent damage with the Shadowflame debuff. The deep poo staff, derived from the Scarlet Chests, is stronger than the Shadow Wand, but
has a lower speed and can't piece, hurting its usefulness. Finally, the Feather Barrier Rod is a good auxiliary weapon. While he is not able to adequately deal with the queen itself, it allows players to work at Royal Jellies and take many down as they pass. Symphonic weapons are great for this battle, as
many of them are distant and making it easy to collect a large amount of damage. Didgeridoo, while slow in speed, pierces enemies and has automatic fire. With C equipped, the pulse often remains on top of the queen, causing a large amount of additional damage. Icy Piccolo is a worthy option for the first
stage of the battle, causing decent damage and inflicted Frostburn debuff, but lacks the piercing to make it viable once the boss starts a quick call for Royal Jelly. Meteorite Gobo is worth considering as the astral clouds the ear worm produces can often damage the newly spawned Royal Jellies, but it's
expensive to use and the quick hits will give the boss a brief invulnerability that often allow him to take no damage from other weapons. At this point of the game, the only viable brass tools require either venturing into the underworld or defeating Skeletron. However, Hot Horn, created from Hellstone Bars,
is a fantastic option against the jellyfish queen, making it worth considering. By vibrating the flame in front of the boss, you can damage it several times and put on fire!. In addition, it has automatic fire and can pierce. Because of their natural piercing properties, each Pre-Hardmode String Tool is viable
against the jellyfish queen. However, to best take advantage of its bouncing opportunities to better deal with Royal Jellies, it is highly recommended to line solid blocks above and below the arena. Of the 4 instruments, Sitar has the highest DPS. Like Boomerangs, Ebonwood or Shadewood Tamburin are
solid sidearms to throw at either the boss or his challenge once in a while. They can even be thrown twice before waiting for their return. Return.
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