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Image: Marvel Entertainment The Avengers are a team of superheroes from the Marvel universe. Each of them has unique powers, personalities and struggles in their lives, which sometimes extend to their missions. In fact, most of the time, things they're dealing with in their own lives are brought into the



fight. In the last film, Thanos apparently took out half the population, and Endgame picks up where the film left off. Trailers have been released show that some of his favorite heroes have made the cut, while others are absent from the image, at least for now. Will heroes be brought from the dead? That's
something that's still unknown, unless you have super internal news about the movie, but it's the Marvel universe, and they can do whatever they want. Bringing characters back from the dead wouldn't be the strangest thing that ever happened. Some say this will also be the last chapter of avengers films,
at least as you know them now. With Captain Marvel being released soon too, a new series of films may take off. Anyway, everyone has a marvel character that fits their personality. So, which Avengers: End game character are you? Take this test and we'll tell you! PERSONALITY Which Naruto
character are you? 5 minutes quiz 5 min trivia can you recognize the popular movie of only one character? 7 Minutes Quiz 7 Min PERSONALITY Are You More Like Michael Scott, Dwight Schrute or Jim Halpert? 5 minutes quiz 5 min personality which Star Wars character are you? 5 minutes quiz 5 min
personality that Avengers: Infinity War Character Are you? 5 Minutes Quiz 5 Min PERSONALITY Choose a Disney character and let's try to guess who it is in just 30 questions 5 minutes quiz 5 min TRIVIA EASY Let's give you three tips, you name the character Harry Potter 6 Minutes Quiz 6 Min TRIVIA
You Can Name all these characters from Super Smash Bros.? 6 Minutes Quiz 6 Min TRIVIA Let's show you a Cartoon House, you tell us what character lives in It 5 Minute Quiz 5 Min TRIVIA HARD Can you guess the star wars character from an iconic line of dialogue? 6 Minutes Quiz 6 Min How much
do you know about dinosaurs? What is an octanal classification? And how do you use an appropriate noun? Lucky for you, HowStuffWorks Play is here to help. Our award-winning website provides reliable and easy-to-understand explanations of how the world works. From fun trials that bring joy to your
day, to eye-catching photos and fascinating lists, HowStuffWorks Play offers something for everyone. Sometimes we explain how things work, other times we ask, but we are always exploring in the name of fun! Because learning is fun, so stay with us! Playing quizzes is free! We send trivial questions and
personality tests every week to inbox. By clicking Sign up you are agreeing to our privacy policy and confirming that you are 13 years or older. Copyright © © InfoSpace Holdings, LLC, a company of System1 Avengers: Endgame marked the completion of Marvel's endless stone journey and saw the
departure of more than one of the fan favorites. While Endgame was kind of final, Marvel still has big plans for the future of the MCU. The studio is looking forward to the release of Spider-Man: Away from Home next month, which will end phase 3, along with a host of other films that are in progress.
Although nothing official has been confirmed, some internal sources claim that Marvel is also working on Avengers 5. Brie Larson goes to The Los Angeles World Premiere of Marvel Studios' 'Avengers: End game' | Photo by Jesse Grant/Getty Images for Disney's 'Avengers 5' is officially happening?
There hasn't been an official word on the upcoming Avengers film yet, but an internal source says Marvel is already giving some ideas. The source, who claims to be close to the project, revealed that Marvel is planning to release another set with our favorite superheroes. The release date is believed to be
the summer of 2022, meaning producers are probably only a few months away from getting something off the ground. That said, Marvel didn't say anything about continuing the Avengers franchise. According to We Got This Covered, there is a chance that Kevin Feige will announce something during the
San Diego Comic-Con, although exactly what is revealed at this time has not yet been seen. Whatever happens, we know that several characters will not be involved in the action, including Black Widow, Iron Man and Captain America. New Avengers will feature a new cast With much of the old guard now
gone, the next Avengers film will likely feature a completely different cast of superheroes. Most people expect Captain Marvel to lead the new group, and it has been said that Feige is working on a Dark Avengers plot or a Young Avengers. Either way, we can expect new characters to take the spotlight,
which is definitely a good thing. Given the success of the Avengers franchise, Disney is unlikely to abandon the concept going forward. If anything, we should expect more to come together as Marvel prepares to enter phase 4 of its grand scheme. Exactly what it seems, of course, is anyone's guess. In
addition to Captain Marvel, several characters survived the war with Thanos and are likely to play a role in the next film. Marvel will also feature new characters in the next phase, many of whom will also be incorporated into the set. What other Marvel movies are in progress? In addition to Avengers,
Marvel is working on several different superhero movies in the coming years. So far, this includes sequels to Doctor Strange and Black Panther, plus a black widow's solo. Little is known about the films Doctor Strange and Black Panther and how they will fit into the next phase the MCU. We can only hope
to learn more at San Diego Comic-Con, although it is unclear how much was developed. The Black Widow's solo tour is also soured by mystery. As the fans are well aware, Black Widow died in Endgame so the team could get the soul stone. At no point in the film was Black Widow brought back to life,
which means that the film will likely be set in its past. Exactly when, of course, it is yet to be seen, but it will be interesting to see how they link their history with the rest of the franchise. In addition to these three films, we also know that the studio is working on Guardians of the Galaxy Vol. 3, although they
have kept the details firmly secret. Unfortunately, there are some characters we know won't be part of the next Avengers movie. This includes Iron Man and Black Widow, both found his death in Endgame. The Captain America storyline also came to an end after the team successfully knocked Out Thanos
in Avengers: Game Over. After traveling back in time to return the stones, Cap decided to stay in the past and live the life he always wanted. The number 3,000 will never be the same for us after watching Avengers: End game. Marvel Studios If you've seen Avengers: Game Over, then you've probably
cried and cried several times during the three-hour extravaganza. Maybe you brought a box of fabrics and cried the whole movie. We get it. The 22nd edition of the Marvel Cinematic Universe is a giant look at the movies before it. It's an emotional and nostalgic roller coaster for fans. During each screening
that Insider attended, sniffers filled the room after a large scene near the end of the film. Now that the film has aired a bit and made over $1 billion on the opening weekend worldwide, let's talk about these great moments. Insider breaks the scenes that hit us hard from a few tears to the full ugly crying.
Many of these moments have more emotional weight for them if you preceded your Endgame watch with some – or all – of the 21 movies that came before it. If you haven't seen the movie, we suggest you don't read it until you get to see it in theaters. If you have it, get a handkerchief and let's discuss it.
Tony Stark shares a brief moment of joy with Nebula at the beginning of the film and he may not have realized how much it meant to the evil blue, as he called it. Marvel Avengers: End game may have had you in tears from your first few minutes. After Clint's family disappeared before his eyes, we opened
up about Tony and Nebula playing a paper football game. The moment was supposed to be a lightweight palette cleaner, but if you're familiar with nebula's story from the Guardians of the Galaxy franchise, it may have made you rip. After Nebula wins, asks if she had fun. The question catches her by
surprise and Nebula slowly considers the question before before she spent so much of her life training to be the perfect warrior for her father, Thanos, that fun was never really on the agenda. Instead, fun consisted of Nebula and Gamora fighting each other over and over again. Each time Nebula lost to
her sister (and that was always), Thanos replaced a part of her with machines. Tony Stark probably didn't realize how much that little moment really meant to Nebula. The last time we saw the Guardians of the Galaxy was with Tony and Nebula. Disney/Marvel Studios Not all of our tears were sad. After
seeing all the sling ring circles popping up around Captain America, Tony, and Thor, you are eagerly left wondering by which stranger will appear. It's not until we see the wizard of Bleecker Street, as Tony refers to him, on the screen that we're sure this should be the successful timeline he envisioned in
Infinite War. And when he gets to the party, it's up to the Guardians. Not only are we thrilled to see Groot again, but it's incredibly gratifying to see that Rocket and Nebula have their family back. This is a bit smaller because we weren't too surprised by everyone's return. We know that director James Gunn
is returning for the third film in the Guardians franchise and we feel very confident about a Doctor Strange 2 as well. Peter doesn't realize at this point how important he's been to Tony. The photo above is one that Tony sat in his kitchen. Marvel One of the sweetest moments in the film was when Tony cut
the ever-rambling Peter Parker to bring him in a big hug. This is a man who, despite clearly seeing enormous potential in Peter, was not in giving the boy a hug at the beginning of Spider-Man: Back home. He said they weren't there yet. When Tony returned to Earth, the first words he said to Cap were that
he lost the boy, referring to Peter. That was before he even asked about Pepper Potts. He even kept a picture of Peter next to his father, Howard, at his home five years later. After a second screening, this scene is more emotional because you know it's the first and last real moment between Tony and
Peter in five years before Stark's death. The moment Peter saw Gamora we knew it wasn't going to work. Marvel Star-Lord thought he would never see his girlfriend again after Thanos killed her in Infinite War. As he was only missing, it seemed, a few moments after Thanos' snap, he still didn't have time
to fully process and mourn his death. When he saw 2014's Gamora on the battlefield it was an incredibly bittersweet moment. He may have thought there was some mistake and that his Gamora was still alive. However, when he learned that gamora he saw had no recollection of him, it was a one-two
punch. Although it was great Gamora back, it was devastating to realize that she knew nothing about her guardian family. Later it was sadder to see Quill was looking for the 2014 version of Gamora that is somewhere in the galaxy. Read more: How Gamora's Appearance in Endgame Can Affect
Guardians of the Galaxy Vol. 3 This was one of the most powerful moments in the film. Marvel Studios One of Endgame's most unexpected moments came during its final battle, when Marvel Studios brought together most of its female heroines in a giant Avengers scene. Okoye, Wasp, Valkyrie, Gamora,
Praying Mantis, Pepper Potts, Scarlet Witch, and more gathered to help Captain Marvel take off thanos' Iron Glove.For women who grew up with superheroes like Superman, Batman and Spider-Man dominating the media, it was a great time to see more than a handful of women together on screen for the
first time in a single shot. For girls growing up in an era where female superheroes are becoming increasingly ubiquitous, it was an uplifting moment of validation to see more than one version of a female heroine represented on screen. The moment was most exciting when you learned you had a direct
return to an Infinity War scene with the now deceased Black Widow. When Thanos' henchman, Promixa Midnight (Carrie Coon), told the Scarlet Witch that she would die alone during the Battle of Wakanda, Black Widow came from behind to say that her friend was not alone. She had Natasha and Okoye
to support her. In Endgame, when Peter Parker asked Captain Marvel how she would possibly cross the battlefield alone, Okoye was the one who said Carol Danvers doesn't have to do it alone. During a second exhibition of Endgame, it is easier to see the death of the planned Black Widow. The death of
the Marvel/YouTube Black Widow was one of Endgame's biggest surprises. As she has a standalone film in progress, many assumed that she would be safe. When INSIDER interviewed 760 Marvel fans prior to the film's release, Black Widow was not among the characters fans said they believed were
more likely to die. About 24% of respondents said they would be upset to see the character leave. In addition to the shock of Widow's death, this scene was carried by the emotion seen on Jeremy Renner's face. We had just seen Hawkeye lose his whole family. Now we were forced to watch him watch
his best friend die and the looks of pain on his face were enough to make us inside We didn't put this higher for a major reason. From the moment we learned that Clint and Natasha designed the short canudos to go to Vormir to acquire the Soul Stone, we knew that one of them probably wouldn't come
back. To acquire the Orange Infinite Stone, you need to sacrifice something you love. The end of the film was a giant hiccup party. Paramount Pictures If you weren't sobbing yet, Happy Hogan probably choked you new when he asked Tony's little girl if she wanted something to eat. Morgan had a simple
answer -- a cheeseburger, cheeseburger, that brought no tears to your eyes, you'll want to take another Iron Man watch. When Tony returns home after being held prisoner by a terrorist organization, the billionaire tells his driver, Happy, that he wants a fast-food cheeseburger. Like father, like daughter. If
you remember the scene, you were probably having trouble seeing through the tears you were trying to hide as Happy told Morgan that his father also liked cheeseburgers. Morgan, of course, wasn't bothered. But we don't. His lip was probably shaking, fearing that the worst was to come. Marvel Studios
From the moment Doctor Strange slowly stuck a finger and looked ominously at Tony, tears began to build up. Strange said there was a way to bring everyone back and Tony understood that it would take the ultimate sacrifice. You may not have been thrilled, however, until Tony showed that he was able
to gain possession of the Infinite Stones and wield the Iron Glove. When Tony said: I am Iron Man and assumed all the power of stones, it was at once exciting and equally disturbing. Yes, it was a comeback for Tony revealing his superhero identity to the world in 2008, but it was also a hint to the
devastating moment to come. If Thanos and Hulk could survive the force of infinity and iron gloves with only serious damage, there was no way Tony could handle it. If you connected these dots from the moment Tony stole thanos stones, you were probably already screaming. The number 3,000 will
never be the same. Marvel Studios Just when you thought you had just cried, Tony Stark returns with one last speech he left for his family and loved ones courtesy of his Iron Man helmet. In the end, he looks at his daughter, and, in turn, the audience, and says, I love you, 3,000, which may have sent you
to an ugly scream. Morgan says the speech earlier in the film to her father when she goes to bed. The line hit so hard, it inspired fans to tweet their love and thank Robert Downey Jr. and Marvel for more than a decade of movies. You probably cried more if you realized that Tony left behind a movie clip of
himself for his little girl the same way his father did years before for him. Read more: The exciting line 'I Love You, 3,000' in 'Avengers: End game' was inspired by the children of Robert Downey Jr. More: Avengers Avengers End game Marvel Movie indicates an expandable section or menu, or sometimes
previous/upcoming navigation options. Options.
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