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File Title: mem_-mac-lide110-1'1'10-e6.dmg File size: 27.81 MBRelease Date: 06/03/2020 Title CanoScan LiDE 110 User Guide (Mac) History macOS 10.15 has been supported. Settings for downloading and installing 1. Download the file. For the location where the file is stored, check your computer settings. 2. Double-click the downloaded file and mount it on the disk
image. 3. Double-click the installed image of the disk. 4. Double-click the packaged file in the folder. The installation starts automatically. XML Delivery ID 5011642219 Online Manual GuideEnglishPage 2Contents-Kvik Menu Guide. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
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as using the driver and application software. Download/Installation Procedures 1. Click on the link, select Save, Save as, then click Save to download the file. Memo: If you choose Run (or Open) rather than Save, the file will be automatically installed once it is saved. 2. The downloaded file will be stored at the specified location in the form of self-extraction (format .exe).3.
Double-click the downloaded EXE file to unpack it, then the installation will start automatically. All software, programs (including, but not limited to drivers), files, documents, guides, instructions or any other materials (collectively, Content) are available on this site based on as is. Canon Marketing (Vietnam) Co., Ltd., and its affiliates (Canon) do not make any guarantees of
any kind regarding content, explicitly waive all guarantees expressed or implied (including, without restrictions, implied trade guarantees, suitability for a specific purpose and is not a violation) and is not responsible for updating, correcting or supporting content. Canon reserves all relevant property, property and intellectual property rights in The Content. You can download
and use Content solely for personal, non-commercial use and at your own risk. Canon is not responsible for any damage in connection with the Content (including, without limitation, indirect, indirect, exemplary or accidental damage). You must not distribute, assign, license, sell, rent, broadcast, broadcast, publish or transmit Content the other side. Nor should you (and
should not allow others) to reproduce, modify, reformat, or create derivatives from Content, in whole or in part. You agree not to send or expel Content from the country/region where you originally received it to other countries/regions without any necessary government authorization and/or in violation of any laws, restrictions or regulations. When you go to downloading
content, you agree to be linked above, as well as all the laws and applicable to the download and use of Content. Contact us for phone or email support to register your product and manage your Canon ID account Find a repair center and find other useful information about our repair process We use cookies to provide you with the best possible experience in your
interaction with Canon and on our website - learn more about our use of cookies and change the cookie settings here. You agree to use cookies on your device by continuing to use our website or by clicking on the I Accept button. You may also need... Contact us for phone or email help registering your product and manage your Canon ID account Find a repair center and
find other useful information about our cookie repair process We use cookies to offer you the best experience in your interaction with Canon and on our website. Learn more about using cookies and change the cookie settings here. You agree to use cookies on your device by continuing to use our website or by clicking on the I accept button. Our goal is to provide you with
access to the content contained in the Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flatbed Scanner 4507B002 training guide as soon as possible. Using an online preview, you can quickly view the index and go to the page where you will find a solution to your problem with Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flatbed Scanner 4507B002. For your convenience, if consulting the Canon CanoScan
LIDE 110 Flatbed Scanner 4507B002 guide directly to the website is not convenient for you, you have two possible solutions: Full Screen Preview - To easily view the user's manual (without downloading it to your computer), you can use full screen mode. To start viewing the Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flatbed Scanner 4507B002 full-screen guide, use the Full Screen
button. Download to your computer - you can also download the Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flat Scanner 4507B002 on your computer and keep it in your collections. However, if you don't want to lose space on your device, you can always download it in the future from ManualsBase. User guide Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flat Scanner 4507B002 Advertising Advertising
Many people prefer to read the documents not on the screen but in the printed version. The ability to print out the guide has also been granted, you can use it by clicking on the link above - Print Guide. You don't need to print all the Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flat Scanner 4507B002, just selected pages. Respect the newspaper. Below you will find previews of the content
contained in the subsequent pages of the guide for Canon CanoScan LIDE 110 Flatbed 4507B002. se voc lese deseja visualizar rapidamente o conte'do das p'ginas subseq'entes, voc pode us'-los. Resumos do conte'do Manuais is similar to Informa'es de contato Banco on-line de manuais © 2020 ManualsBase.com. All rights are reserved. 1 Scanner 2 USB Cable 3
Setting UP CD-ROM 4 Guide to Fast Launch (this document) Installation software - DO NOT connect the scanner to your computer before installing the software. When you plug in the scanner, disconnect the USB cable from your computer. When the screen is found Found new equipment, disable the USB cable from the computer and click Cancel. The screen can
automatically close when the USB cable is turned off. Stop all running apps before you install. For Windows: Remove the software complete with the Canon scanner before upgrading from Windows Vista to Windows 7, then install the bundled software again. For Macintosh: After an update with Mac OS X v.10.5 or below to Mac OS X v.10.6, install the software complete
with a Canon scanner. Log in as an administrator to install the software. Don't switch users during the installation process. 1 Place the CD-ROM in the disk. For Macintosh: Double-click the settings icon. Enter the admin id and password in the authentication dialog field. For Windows XP and Macintosh, skip Step 2 and move on to Step 3. 2 For Windows 7/Windows Vista,
when the AutoPlay Dialog Window (No.1) appears, start the settings program and then click Yes or Continue to Act when the User Account Control Dialog (No.2) arrives. 3 If asked, choose your language and residence, then click Next. In some countries, these dialog windows will not appear. 4 Click Easy installation on the main menu (No. 3). 5 Click Set to start installing.
Read the License Agreement carefully and then click Yes to continue. For Macintosh, skip Step 6 and move on to step 7. 6 For Windows, read Please allow all masters processes, and then click Next. 7 Follow the instructions on the screen to perform the installation. 8 For users in the U.S., when there is a screen of user registration, follow the instructions on the screen to
provide product support. 9 When the screen of the extended survey program appears, confirm it. If you can agree, click Agree. 10 When the installation is complete, follow the instructions on the screen. For Windows: Click Exit. For Macintosh: Click Out. If you tap OK on the Canon Solution Menu EX dialog box, you'll see an EX solution menu. You can choose either the MP
Navigator EX, On-Screen Guide, or the online US registration. For Windows: When you start your computer next time, The EX menu will appear automatically. When you restart your computer, do the Preparing scanner operation in advance. If the solution menu only shows the Help and Settings menu, it's not that you're looking at it. Connect the scanner to your computer
and wait a while, then turn to the EX menu solution online to help and set up the scanner. For Macintosh: If the Canon EX Solution menu icon is not found in the dock, you can start the Menu EX solution from THE ON-Screen Manual' Menu Solution. To add the Canon Solution EX menu icon to the dock, check out The Solution Menu EX online help. 1 Slide the lock switch at
the bottom of the scanner to the unlock mark (Always lock the scanner when it's transported or transported. 2 Connect the scanner to your computer using a USB cable supplied. When the scanner is connected to the USB 1.1 port and this device can run faster or the HI-SPEED USB device is connected to a non-HI-SPEED USB hub message appears, ignore the message.
: Double-click the Canon Solution EX menu icon and then tap the MP Navigator EX 4.0 icon on the Start Application menu. For Macintosh: Tap the Canon EX solution menu icon in the dock and then tap the MP Navigator EX icon under the Start Application menu. 3 Click Photos / Documents (Platen). 4 Choose a color photo in the type of document. 5 Tap Scan to start
scanning. Do not move the scanner while it is working. I don't see the light directly during the scan. 6 When asked that the scan is complete, click Exit. 7 Click Save to save the images and close MP Navigator EX (No. 1). See the back page instructions for using scanner buttons. NO5-3118-V01 XXXXXXXX ©CANON INC. 2010 ). Lower Upper Fast Start Guide No. 1 No. 2
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