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» Home » Machines » Printers » Inks - Textile printers made for medium to large size direct to garment printers, Storm Hexa offers an economic approach to printing. Storm Hexa gives you 30% more color options by introducing red and green to CMYK. Storm Kornit HEXA, part of the R Kornit series, is
offering the widest color gamut for a stunning, real-life print production. Hexa storm ensures accelerated printing speed, digital industrial textile printing technology and can afford storm platform. This is the perfect choice for small to medium-sized businesses looking to scale up in full color while keeping
costs low. Storm Kornit HEXA and Storm 1000 are the most cutting edge printers on the best-selling storm platform, providing tremendous speed with maximum color combinations. The ink re-circulation mechanism reduces the need to clear printing heads, increase the lifespan of printing heads and
significantly reduce waste and ink costs. Printing up to 170 garments per hour has maximum print resolution of up to 1200 dpi superior prints on any material, including light and dark clothing. No need to pre-treat separately or press heat. Re-circulation of ink increases the reliability of production and
reduces printing costs. integrated humidity system . The printing area - up to 20 x 28 in /50 x 70 cm battery backup system - integrated our two Kornit II Hexa for sale both priced at £80,000 individually. Available as pairs or unit units. Prices are only for equipment, transportation and commission charges at
the expense of buyers. Both machines are maintained to a very high standard with all the maintenance work done on the machines by Kornit engineers. Currently, they are still in production and are open to live print shows &amp; demonstrations before buying.   » Dorset Rhotex 322 fabric parnity color 7 C
CMYL lc lm lk , 1200 dpi , speed 140 m2/hDurst Rhotex 322 Textilprinter in the best industrial conditions printing fabric with 3 print width . 2m color 7C CMYK lc lm lk resolution 1200 dpi fine greyscale speed up to 140 square meters per hour automatic loading material in 2 minutes hp work 24h/7 days a
week new product working properly €99.000.0000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000 0 995,00 Aug-12-2020 Germany(Dortmund) » DuPont Artristri 3320 Ichinose DuPont Artristri 3320
Ichinose2007 DuPont Artistri 3320 16 print heads print configuration 2x 8 one ink chemistry 1 x 8 two ink chemistries resolution 540x600 44m2 1-pass 30m2 2-pass Ink types : DuPont Artristri Acid Dye, Reactive Dye, Disperse the color and ink of pigments. This car... Product used working properly €
30.000,00 June - 12 -2020 Belgium (Nile) » Epson F2000 in full printer condition in full condition. The head and consumables changed and were prepared for customer printing. Consumables and spare parts can be quoted separately. The product used works properly 2 bidsbuy now € 2.500,00 € 7.450,00
Bulgaria (Sofia) » Mimaki JV5-320 DS for direct sale to fabric and transfer large printed paper printer format for direct printing to fabric or paper transfer. Currently in production, working in good condition, with bulk ink system installed and chip reset - can be used with any color ink below available. Heavy
winder and unwinder OEM option, ... Use product working properly buy now € 10.000,00 € 10.000,00 January - 29 - 2020 Romania (Bucharest) » La Meccanica Coe HS Mimaki JV5-160 Digital Jet Ink Printer for TextileLa Meccanica Qualijet HS - Based on Mimaki JV5-160S 160 cm print width. Glue
blankets with machine washing units and all four heads &amp; nozzles work properly. Now print on silk and on nylon, can easily be filled with reaction,... Product used working properly 1 bidbuy now € 9.000,00 € 18.000,00 January-23-2020 Italy (como, Colorado) » HP Scitex XLJet 5 Premium HP Scitex
XLJet 5 Premium-10/2007 Upgrade Premium Version Scitex XLJet 5 Premium Man: 2005 - 10// 2007 Upgraded to Premium Version SN:2351 Configuration: CMYK (8ph per channel) Ink: The original HP 300 Backlite option we are providing the following spare parts with the device included in the price -



represents almost seconds... The product used to work properly buy now offer €30.000,00 January -15-2020 Czech Republic (Prague) » RHOTEX 322 Dorset Rhotex 322 6C (CMYK + Lc + Lm) printer was purchased at Dorset Phototechnic AG factory in 2018 and has a valid official warranty. Production
Year: 2014. Maximum printing width: 320cm. Maximum thickness: 2 mm. Print resolution: 600x400dpi. Efficiency: 140 m/h. The product... Product used to work properly € 85.000,00 December - 27- 2019 Ukraine (Kyiv) » ATP Textile Printer - Roland Digital Straight Textile Printer with Stabilized
CallanderSecond Hand Straight to Textile Printer in appropriate conditions Of Product Use Working Properly 1 bidsbu y currently €500,00 euros 7.500,00 November - 23-2019 Romania (Bucuresti) » Kornit Storm II Textile Printer Cornite Storm II Production Date - 2013 Revised Main Board in 20135,
hoses and computers 2018 equipped with children's clothing palettes are generally good condition used for around 120 000 printed products working properly 1 bidbuy now € 36,000,00 € 38.00 00 November - 13 - 2019 Bulgaria (Sofia) » Dgen Teleios Grand G5 - In stabilizing digital line straight textile
printer with large inline fixationDgen Teleios Grand G5 with fixation in straight textile printer line with large fixation on-line, 330cm print width, 8 rico G5 head print ,in two rows 4 colors,native 600 dpi, 7 pl/ dot. 8 grayscale levels currently working with Caldera Rip, include: textile ... Product used working
properly € 49.500,00 November - 07 -2019 Romania (Bragadiru) Kornit Digital &gt; Printing Solutions &gt; Kornit'sCo System &gt; QuickP Designer Quick Download Designer Brochure benefits of increasing productivity up to five times your easy processing speed And the new exciting color control
management preparation offline image configuration control and location, allows resizing, rotating and displacing the image with a fully automated one-click control for white and ultra-white opacity new ink estimates the consumption of advanced semi-transparent image processing tools three saturation
levels to define the color density preview of white channels cost saving, by shortening the rotation time and production programs both Automatic and manual image processing options create white layer with QuickP Designer, do not require photoshop color management and ICC profile support for
converting RGB files to CMYK QuickP Designer for Kornit Printer Exhibition state-of-the-art features for fast processing of image files, without the need for external rip-off applications. With its exceptional variety, QuickP Designer is perfect for handling and controlling multiple businesses. It features a very
friendly interface and should have automation tools. Eliminate the need for Photoshop and other external applications! QuickP Designer offers outstanding image quality for businesses with tight production plans. Achieve a wide variety of colors and shades to print premium artwork in both light and dark-
colored clothing as you produce customized prints of extraordinary quality for your customers. The lower cost of ownership increases your processing speed, increasing your productivity. Improved workflow – Easier setup and control, larger preview area, common look and feel, creating automatic white
layers and backward compatibility with Kornit printers. New Color Management – New and exciting color improvements and options allow for enhanced and sophisticated color control without the need for Photoshop. Estimate ink consumption and assess offline costs! QuickP Designer enables you to
estimate the cost of ink per print for a specific task. Estimated ink consumption for each color channel optimizes the use of ink – measuring ink consumption expected ahead of printing. Predict real costs – achieve very accurate results with an algorithm that calculates total consumption for each work. Ink
Estimation Database – User-friendly files store ink consumption information for all jobs sent to the printer. Windows 7 Operating System – English Version, Windows 8, Windows 10 Hardware Requirements Intel Dual Processor 3GHz, 2 GB RAM per processor, One USB port required for security key , CD
drive required, C: Drive requirements Industry Standards SUPPORT ICC Profile Support Input Formats TIP, SCT, JPG, TGA, PNG, PSD, BMP Support Printer Bahman 1000 , Bahman HEXA, Bahman HEXA-R, Bahman - R, Bahman - R, Bahman, Bahman DC Pro , Storm HEXA, Storm 1000, Storm Duo,
Storm II (QuickP Production 3.0.x.x), Avalanche 1000 (QuickP Production 5.0.x.x), Storm 931 (QuickP Production 14.0.0.3 or 14.0.x.x), Thunder 932 (QuickP Production 14.0.0.3), Breeze Breeze Paradigm II Download QuickP Designer Brochure More Info Kornit Storm 1000paula wood2020-05-
25T10:36:43+02:00 Storm Kornit 1000 and Storm Hexa most cutting edge printer on the storm platform, providing tremendous speed with maximum color combinations. The ink recycling mechanism reduces the need to clean up printing heads, increase the lifespan of printing heads and significantly
reduce waste and ink costs. Storm 1000 and Hexana are the latest additions to the Cornite Storm platform, the best-selling printer direct to Cornite Apparel. The storm platform is part of Kornit's full line of printers, providing a scalable solution that can grow with your business. Download Brochure Ink
Recycling Mechanism – Uninterrupted Flow Of Ink Reduces Puzzle Eclipse, Eliminates Quick Clearing Of 4litre Bulk Pallet Exchange in k Printing System Direct Method to NeoPigment Type Ink Clothing™ Ink (Color: Cyan, Magenta, Yellow, Black, Red, Green, White.) Bulk ink system supports 4 liters
and 1,5 liters printing head 12 total heads, 8 CMYK heads 2 each, 4 white heads printing area up to 20 x 28/50 x 7 0 cm Woven/Knitted/Non-Woven Natural Bed Printing: Cotton, Linen, Viscose and more Synthetic: Polyester, Nylon and More Protein Based: Silk, Wool and More Blend: 50/50
Cotton/Polyester and More Throughput (Shirt/Hour) Light Clothing : Up to 190, Dark clothing: Up to 85 dimensions 114 x 80 x 65 in / 290 x 202 x 165 cm weight almost. 170 5kg power requirements 110/220V, 60/50 Hz, 40A, 3Ph+N+PE Windows XP operating system and Windows 7 print resolution up to
1200 dpi Operating conditions Temperature: 18°C - 30°C / 64.4 °F - 86°F , Humidity: 45%-95% Relative humidity, Non-congested as part of our full digital printing solution, Kornit Digital has developed three software packages, geared specifically to our high-tech printers. These software packages are
tools that help produce, design and manage print jobs. Designed to add value to your production process, and to simplify your workflow, this tool is user-friendly, fast to set up and demand very little maintenance. Download QuickP Brochure www.kornit.com www.kornit.com
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