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When internationalizing entrepreneurs are advised to be



1. Given that most start-up operators fail, why do entrepreneurs find so many new companies? Why is the (majority) government interested in promoting more startups? Entrepreneurs are the ones who see the opportunity to make a business start-up plan and manage it using existing
resources for the benefit of profitability. There are many people who start a new business, but unfortunately only a few people have been successful in their ventures. Most startups fail. Some of the reasons they fail are:- Market problems - the failure of the business model - the bad
management team - run out of cash - product problems, but also some entrepreneurs who never give up and meet. Many new companies They found many new companies because they seemed to have a strong desire for success and were willing to take risks and withstand ambiguity.
Entrepreneurs play an important role in economic development as an important contributor to technological innovation and the growth of new jobs. In addition, entrepreneurs help build communities in ways such as employment, local business operations, building and engaging in
entrepreneurial networks, investing in community projects and giving them to local charities. Recognizing the economic and social impact of multi-state entrepreneurs and local communities has adopted aggressive strategies aimed at cultivating and nurturing entrepreneurs. Securing capital
is critical to the success of entrepreneurs, especially in the early stages of development. The state can help entrepreneurs to find seed capital through direct investment, limited-venture partnerships and tax credits. Technical assistance in building a Small Business Help Center Science and
technology companies and programs that provide financial advice and management are valuable services for entrepreneurs. Improving securities regulations allows process operators to pass on the search for funds. Improving state regulations and licensing environments reduces the
burden on operators seeking licenses and licenses. A one-stop business center can serve as a point of contact between all operators and state regulators. Improving the registration and licensing process can be useful for both operators and government agencies by reducing the repetition
of the process, documents, time and resources needed to register new businesses properly. Encouraging educational entrepreneurs to build a foundation for successful entrepreneurship In higher education, the creation of intellectual capital at public universities promotes entrepreneurship,
while superior research centers help universities attract. Maintaining the highest quality faculty, stimulating technological innovation and helping to transfer technology to the private sector. Secondary education is important as well, at least increasing the perception of entrepreneurship as a
career option. Creating industry groups and entrepreneurial networks is beneficial to economic and entrepreneurial economic development strategies. Entrepreneurs can develop contacts and fill specific industry niches within clusters and networks. Targeting entrepreneurs through the State
Economic Development Agency and business development centers can help educate them about existing services and programs. Advertising in commercial publications, communication through the Local Chamber of Commerce, industry associations and public service announcements, is
just a few ways the government can send messages effectively. 2. Some people suggest that the international market is a graveyard where the company is more entrepreneurial- If you own a company in a reasonably profitable small country, would you consider expanding overseas? Why
are both of the messages listed in this question true? The international market can become a graveyard for Some entrepreneurial companies tend to expand themselves too. It can also be the future for most SMEs, everything depends on the type of business, the right strategy of the
operator to go global and the proper implementation of their plans and strategies in the host country. If I own a company in a small, reasonably profitable country, I would certainly consider expanding it overseas. If my company has already gone through the growth phase and is going into
maturity, it is time for my company to think about its strategy to expand further. For it may be, we can change our business model and start doing business with new people in our home country. But if our current business model can be used to grow businesses overseas and continue to
succeed abroad as well, why not? Can enter the international market through three wide models. Licensing direct exports/franchises direct investment from abroad, but to the world is not easy, we need to choose the country where our business model is most feasible. Proper market
research will help us succeed in this sector. In research, we need to analyze both the formal and informal institutions available in the host country. Not only institutions, but we need to find out if the necessary resources are available in the host country for proper business operations. There
are many benefits to doing business abroad. Some of them are: I) more customers to the world means one will get access to the larger market and the larger market will definitely be. When one expands internationally, they will be able to access a greater number of highly educated
professionals, skilled workers and unskilled workers III). More profit will increase the number of potential consumers of the product and one will be able to pull the profit margin higher. When exporting a product, of course, the cost of the product will go up, but consumers in developing
countries will pay for access to high quality and well-branded products. IV) More efficient, it means that one can increase its edge and also reduce production costs, one can offset the export cost of the price can keep more competition in the home country V) Iterate faster and create better
export products means reaching out to consumers with taste reviews and ways to interact with the world around them. It is the future after serving local consumers, the ultimate goal of the company is to go global and into the future.   3. Explain the basic international strategy for
entrepreneurs to enter the international market. Describe the international strategy for staying in the domestic market. Enterprise companies can be universal by entering the international market through the entry mode, such as I) direct export, direct export, direct export, bring the sale of
products made by the operator companies in their home country to customers in other countries. This strategy is interesting because entrepreneurial companies can reach foreign customers directly. When the domestic market experiences an economic downturn, overseas sales may offset
such declines. However, one major drawback is that SMEs may not have enough resources to turn overseas opportunities into profits II) licensing/franchises, the second way to enter the international market is through licensing and/or franchisees. Typically used in the manufacturing
industry, licensing refers to firm A's agreement to give Company B the right to use proprietary technology of A (such as patents) or trademarks (such as company logos) for royalties paid to A by B. Assume (hypothetically) that U.S. exporters cannot track demands in Turkey. It may consider
giving Turkish companies licenses to use technology and trademarks for a fee.  Franchisees are essentially the same idea, except it is often used in secondary industries such as fast food. One advantage is that SME lenders and franchisees can expand overseas while running a small risk
of using their own capital. Foreign companies interested in becoming licensed or franchised are Put your own funds forward. For example, a McDonald's franchise now costs the franchise about one million dollars. But issuers and franchisees are also at risk because they may lose control
over how they use their technology and brand name. If a McDonald's licensee (hypothetical) In Finland, producing products below the standard that damage the brand and refuse to improve the quality, McDonald's has two difficult choices: (1) One choice is complex and costly III, FDI, the
third entry mode is that FDI FDI may involve all greenfield-owned subsidiaries, strategic alliances with foreign companies and/or the acquisition of foreign companies by growing roots overseas. The company is increasingly committed to providing international market services. It is close to
international customers, both physically and mentally. Compared to licensing and franchisees Companies have better control over how proprietary technology is used. However, FDI has two major disadvantages: cost and complexity. It requires both a non-capital sum and a commitment to a
major deal. While direct exports may be lucrative, many SMEs simply do not have the resources to manage such tasks, but they can still reach foreign customers through indirect exports, which involve exports through domestic export intermediaries. Export intermediaries act as key
middlemen by linking domestic sellers and overseas buyers who, otherwise, will not be connected. To be a custom operator, an export intermediary, facilitating the universality of many SMEs II) supplying foreign companies, the second strategy is to become a supplier for Foreign companies
doing business in the domestic market For example, when Metro opened a restaurant in Northern Ireland, it secured a contract for chilled baked bread with local bakeries. This relationship was so successful that now the bakery supply subway franchises across Europe, SME suppliers may
therefore be universal by piggybacking on large foreign participants III) becoming the license/franchise of three foreign companies, the operator may consider becoming a licensee or franchisee of foreign brands. Licensors and foreign franchisees provide training and transfer of technology
for a certain fee. Therefore, SME can learn a lot about how it works according to world-class standards. In addition, if sufficient learning is successful, it is possible to terminate the relationship and reap the profits of more entrepreneurs. IV) Join The participant is the fourth strategic partner is
a direct partner of foreign investors. Confronted with the onslaught of aggressive MNEs, many entrepreneurial companies may not be able to successfully defend their market position. Then it makes sense to keep track of the old adage. While dancing with giants is tricky, it is better to be
crushed by them. V) Harvest and exit through the sale-sold to eventual foreign participants, as a strategy to harvest and exit, the trader may sell all shares or company to foreign participants of an American couple from Seattle creating a coffee chain like Starbucks in the UK called Seattle
Coffee. When Starbucks entered the UK, the couple sold a chain of 60 stores to Starbucks for up to $84 million, in terms of the high failure rates of startups acquired by foreign participants, potentially helping to maintain the business in the long run.   4.Can the operator strengthen his/her
ability to succeed in the international market? In general, there are two versions for universality. The stage model is a form of universality, which demonstrates the slow process and step-by-step SME must pass to its international business. As a fast cosmopolitan, some advocates argue that
every industry has become global, and entrepreneurial companies need to go after these opportunities quickly. For me, it is very important for any entrepreneur to follow the stage model, where companies will enter closed markets of culture and institutions first, then spend enough time to
accumulate experience abroad, and then gradually move from more traditional modes (such as exports) to more complex strategies (such as FDI) in distant markets. Stage models warn that inexperienced swimmers may drown in unfamiliar international waters. So how can an entrepreneur
strengthen his/her ability to be successful internationally? The answer boils down to two elements. Firstly, institutional-based views confirm that a large institutional framework explains a great deal about what lies behind differences in entrepreneurial development and the global economy.
Entrepreneurs should have overall knowledge of formal and informal institutions, which are prevalent in the host country. This knowledge will certainly have an effect while conducting business overseas. Secondly, the view by resource posits that most are intangible resources such as drive
vision and willingness to risk fuel operators around the world. Therefore, it is important for Have knowledge of formal and informal institutions and other resources based on perspective. Secondly, when it is universal, entrepreneurs should be bold and venture offshore. But being bold doesn't
mean it's reckless. A wide range of international strategies allows entrepreneurial companies to stay in the domestic market. When entrepreneurial companies are not ready to take higher risks abroad, this more limited involvement may be appropriate. In other words, it's bold, but not too
bold. It is very important that entrepreneurs have to be patient and open minded. Reference: global business books
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