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This study was supported/partially supported by the Foundation's Name, Grant Producer, Donor. We thank our colleagues at the Auxiliary Institution who have provided information and experience that have greatly contributed to the study, although they may disagree with all the interpretations/conclusions
of this paper. We thank Name, Name for their help in special technique, methodology and name, position, name of the institution for comments that greatly improved the manuscript. We would also like to express our gratitude (name, name, institution) for sharing pearls of wisdom with us during this study,
and we thank 3 anonymous reviewers for their so-called ideas. We are also immensely grateful (names and posts) for their comments on an earlier version of the manuscript, although any errors are our own and should not tarnish the reputation of these respected people. First of all, I would like to express
my sincere gratitude to my advisor Professor Iingu for his continued support of my doctoral research and research, for his patience, motivation, enthusiasm and great knowledge. His leadership helped me throughout the study and writing this thesis. I couldn't imagine having the best counselor and mentor
for my doctoral study. In addition to my counsel, I would like to thank the rest of my dissertation committee: Professor Aggelos K. Katsaggelos, Professor Trasivulos N. Pappas and Dr. James Crenshaw for their support, insightful comments and difficult questions. I also sincerely thank Dr. James
Crenshaw, Dr. Senthil Periaswamy and Dr. Kyung Liu for offering me summer internship opportunities in their groups and leading me to work on various exciting projects. I thank my fellow lab technicians in the Northwest Vision Group: Gang Hua, Ting Yu, Jiming Fan, Shengyang Dai, Junsong Yuan,
Jiang Xi, Jialue Fan, and Neelabh Gupta, for stimulating discussions, for the sleepless nights we worked together before the deadline, and for all the fun we've had in the last four years. I also thank my friends at Tsinghua University: Chen Fang, Wensheng Wang, Bo Tsin, Xiwei Wang, Yonggan zhao, Hua
Chen, Junlin Li and Rui zhou. In particular, I am grateful to Dr. Chen Fan for enlightening me at first sight. Last but not least, I would like to thank my family: my parents, Xiyy Yang and Siaolan Ding, for giving birth to me in the first place and supporting me spiritually throughout my life. Here are 14
examples of recognizing your thesis to inspire you. They cover a range of academic subjects and all from UK students. Notice how they differ in length, style and content. Note - all samples are taken from documents available in the public sphere. Don't forget Keep your confessions the maximum page. So
let's dive right in! Example 1S save you to my my my Dr. Andrew R., to provide recommendations and feedback throughout this project. Thank you also to my wife Anna, for putting up with me sitting in the office for hours on end, and for providing guidance and sound boards when needed. Example 2 I
would like to thank the following people for their assistance in this research project: Representatives of Historic England, Historic Scotland, the Society for the Protection of Scottish Buildings and the Sustainable Buildings Alliance for their willingness to disseminate their knowledge. All conservation and
heritage team members who have the wrong time to fill out my questionnaire and who have made such a thorough contribution through their further comments and emails. I would like to thank in particular the conservationists who agreed to be interviewed. Brenda., my mentor who led me so positively and
who always eclipsed me to feel confident in my abilities after coming off the phone to her. Jan W. for his help in statistics. My husband and children for their patience and support. Example 3 I would like to thank the following people without whom I would not have been able to complete this study, and
without whom I would not have made it through my master's degree! The XY team at Johnson University, especially to my supervisor Dr. Paul S., whose understanding and knowledge on the subject guided me in this study. And a special thanks to Linda T., whose support within her doctorate allowed my
research to go the extra mile (sorry for all the extra work Linda did!). Dundee residents who didn't have the time to return surveys and allowed me into their homes for follow-up surveys, and without whom I wouldn't be content with my thesis. My colleagues from the Old Building Trust and the Old Building
Foundation who have supported me and have been in suspense and moaning for the last three years of training! And my greatest thanks to my family for all the support you have shown me through this study, the culmination of three years of distance learning. For my children, sorry for being even
grumpier than usual while I was writing this thesis! And for my wife Jenny, thank you for your support, without which I would have stopped this research a long time ago. You were amazing and now I will clean all the paper from the kitchen table as I promised! I would like to thank the following people who
helped me to conduct this study: My supervisor, Dr. Peter B., for his enthusiasm for the project, for its support, support and patience; Institute of Energy and Sustainability, Johnson University, to participate in this MSc program. For their contribution to data collection: David K at Tech David K, VS



LimitedSteven MConal M., Engineer, County CouncilThe good people of Brighton who have been so generous with their time in filling out survey questionnaires. My partner Billy -- I just couldn't do it. You are a special thank you. Dear friends and family and Hattie.And for my parents who put me on the
way to this MSc a long time ago. I would like to thank Mr. Joe Smith for guiding me to his important publications and to stimulating questions on artificial intelligence and automation. Meetings and conversations were vital in inspiring me to think outside the box, from different perspectives, to form
comprehensive and objective criticism. First of all, I would like to express my sincere gratitude to the Bovill Scholarships, the UK Government's Global Scholarship Programme, funded by the Foreign and Commonwealth Office (FCO) and partner organisations, for allowing me to be part of this incredible
network of leaders. In addition, I would like to thank my manager Alejandro for his thoughtful comments and recommendations on this thesis. I am also grateful to the Engineering School and all its staff for all the careful recommendations. In conclusion, I cannot forget to thank my family and friends for
their unconditional support in this very intense school year. I would like to thank my Supervisor Professor Mark W. and Liam H. for their consistent support and leadership during this project. In addition, I would like to thank the rest of the study group students for their joint efforts during the data collection. I
would also like to mention the school in Bradford for their participation and participation in the study. I would like to thank my leader, Gina K., for her dedicated support and leadership. Gina was constantly supportive and was always willing and enthusiastic to help in any way she could throughout the
research project. I would also like to thank Andrew. for providing advice on the analysis. Finally, a big thank you to all the participants who took part in the study and allowed this study to be possible. With great gratitude to my supervisor, Dr. Martin G., for his leadership in this study. Jenny R., Head of the
Dissertation Module, for her support and support throughout the process. In addition, my mentor, Josh B., would not have been able to study and meet female leaders without it. Finally, all the women who have sacrificed their time and the support of these well-known companies for their participation. I
would like to express my gratitude and appreciation to Barbara S., whose leadership, support and support have been invaluable throughout this study. I would also like to thank the CIL team, who have been a great source of support. First, I would like to express my gratitude to my patient and supportive
supervisor, Tao J., who has supported me throughout this research project. I'm very grateful for friendly conversations at the end of our meetings and your personal support in my academic and business endeavors. I would also like to thank my and customers who took the time to think about their choice of
consumption. Thanks for expressing your thoughts so eloquently and your feminism so unapologetically. I would like to say a special thank you to my supervisor, Jenny R. Her support, leadership and shared understanding in this area have made this an inspiring experience for me. I would also like to
thank all the women who participated in the interview. Finally, I would like to thank my family for their support during this dissertation. I would like to thank Rick B. for his continued support throughout this project. Guy R., via Dyesol and Philip L. for their SIM images of porous stone. I would also like to thank
Dr. Steven M. for his advice throughout the project. Finally, I would like to thank Maureen H. at the University of Freetown for giving me the opportunity to visit her and her explanation of the various methods. From the bottom of my heart, I would like to say a big thank you to all members of the
Bioelectronics Research Group for their energy, understanding and assistance throughout my project, especially To Mr. D.N. for directing the entire gel, to Mr. Andrew L. for their assistance in imaging AFM and to Mr. Samuel D.H. for advising on the DNA analysis process. It really was a very, very good
time in this lab. I would also like to say a special thank you to Professor P.V. and Dr. R.S., without your help and wise guidance this project would not be the same! Visit our blog for more topics including Harvard Links and Youtube Youtube acknowledgement in research sample pdf. acknowledgement in
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