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Wow. What a great book! Not at all what I expected. Totally unique, and it's kind of a disgrace. I mean, why hasn't a story like this been told before? A pre-civil rights story about an African-American man who isn't a door mat shouldn't be such an innovative concept, but it is. yes, the fact that he's almost a superhuman
hero was kind of hard for me to swallow at first. But then I remembered reading a lot of books with similar books off the charts, male heroes like Superman (spies, assassins wow. what a great book! not at all what I expected. totally unique, and it's kind of a disgrace. I mean, why isn't a story like that ever told before? a
pre-civil rights story about an African-American man who isn't a door mat shouldn't be achieved so innovatively, but it is. The fact that he's almost a superhuman hero was a little hard for me to swallow at first. But then I remembered reading a lot of books with similar books off the charts, male heroes like Superman
(spies, assassins, and other types of James Bond) - they were just never black in the 1920s! The protagonist, King Tremaine, is not a layered figure either, but some others are. The star in that sense should be Serena, an incredibly complex character, a character that actresses would fight for if he ever made a movie. I
must also commend writer Guy Johnson for his craft in one particular area that interests me. He does something very rare in this story - something you barely see in books, and never in movies or television. In this book there are several instances in which the author hints at a potential plot direction, only to eventually die
in silence. Note, I'm certainly not talking about the heavy plot twists that writers and screenwriters usually use to deliberately manipulate emotions. No, I'm talking about the very routine way the story lines stem and flow in real life. We have ideas, aspirations and intentions that evolve over time. Some we pursue, and they
become reality, others... Just don't. For a million different reasons. Sometimes we get distracted, or we're not motivated. Sometimes predictable opportunities don't present themselves. Sometimes we just change. Sometimes others do. Sometimes key people disappear from our lives unexpectedly. That's how life, real
life, is. Quietly unpredictable. But rarely do you see it depicted in print, and even less on screen. On TV, if you see a hint plot direction, it always plays out. Always. If the lead detective just happens to run into an old college friend on the way to court it will always have implications for the plot; Nothing's wasted. Now, to be
fair, on TV they have an excuse for it, because they have a fixed time constraint, so they don't have time to document all the subtle complexities of real life. However, writers don't have that constraint, so Never understood why they so willingly get into this laziness that doing so makes their story predictable in the same
way as TV shows usually do. Well, that writer didn't give up. This book was very unpredictable, in quiet ways. It was dead people. Main characters you expected things from. Just die. Out of nowhere, off camera. At some point (spoiler) Serena is considering a collaboration with the Dumont clan, and I started sweating out
the consequences of that... But... Anything... Ever... Got away with it. Bad starts. Just like in real life. Made me feel like I was really reading about real life (except maybe for the superhuman black hero ;^)... More editing Our deepest memories live on the coastline... Where the Atlantic Meets Solid Ground Plot Digest |
Add Tags Abstract: Celebration of the Great Immigration Parental Guide: Add Advisory Content to Parents » Editing Charleston Photos include St Julian Dash (1916-1974) tenor saxophonist and composer of Tuxedo Junction (1939) as a member of the band Erskine Hawkins. See more » Q: What motivated you to write
standing on the scratch line? A: I wrote it as a back story for another novel. This other novel centers around King's grandson and the king is depicted only in flashbacks, but because he tried to establish the memory of King's grandson as a force that had the power to influence his actions, I should have known the king
better. The grandson saw his grandfather as evil, but I knew the King was more than that. Therefore, I had to inform him, determine what events motivated him, try to explain how a violent person doesn't necessarily have evil in his heart. I also wanted to show that while a character may have gained control of things like
he can control them, the really important elements in life like health, love, the birth and death of children, are in the hands of fate, or other forces far beyond our nest. Q. The basic messages in your novel seem to be a family and black self-reliance. Why did you choose the action/adventure genre to view this message? A:
I didn't write this book with a message in mind. I'm a storyteller. I just wanted to bring to life some of the people I knew growing up and I wanted to entertain the readers. If I come across some truths in my writing, so much better but while I'm still in the first phase of my career as a writer, there's no message; I'm just
asking to entertain. It's true, though, that when I look around at American fiction I don't often see powerful African-American male characters who are invincible at the end of the story. But I knew people like that, people who grew up during racism and discrimination were still the standard of polite white Americans. I
wanted to see a man like that, undeterred by the magnifications of his time, get up for the road. Standing on the scratch line written as Because I love adventure. I like tension. I love scenes that squint you into them. And that's a good story. Q: We are constantly bombarded by slings and arrows of outrageous fortunes,
but most people don't pick up guns in response. What am I? About King allowing him to fight fire with fire? Was he born this way, or is it the result of socialization? A: The right to bear arms and face injustice is a fundamental issue in the American concept of masculinity and heroism. All you have to do is look at the
formula used in the inclusion of the films that were made. I don't necessarily subscribe to that thinking, but if it didn't exist, the NRA would have disappeared years ago. This is an American story about an American who reached adulthood fighting in World War I. There's nothing unusual about it except that the hero is
black. King Tremaine's violence was a product of his times. In 1919, more than 100 black men and women lynched. Free blacks have had to defend themselves against the berth aspects of racism since this country was born. King Tremaine may be an outlier in American literature, but he wasn't in American life. People
like King existed throughout the United States and especially in the Deep South. Otherwise black Americans had nothing in states like Arkansas, Georgia, Mississippi, Louisiana, Florida, Tennessee, Alabama, Texas and Oklahoma. In disputes over water rights and land ownership they certainly could not have expected
local authorities to defend their rights. Q: How much of the king was based on your grandfather? A: King Tremaine's idea came up from his memories. Part of it is definitely on the Scratch line, but it's much more visible in the sequel, Echoes of a Distant Summer. Some scenes in the first book are loosely based on some
of the stories I've heard about my grandfather. Although the sequel is mostly about his grandson, the king has great characters twisting and turning events. The king is revealed through flashbacks through which he establishes himself as a higher power in memory of his grandson. Q: As a writer do you feel pressure that
they are the son of a famous writer? Did it have an effect on you as an artist? A: I wouldn't say I feel pressure, but I'm aware of how hard it is to be a successful writer and what a mountain it is to climb and how, unlike Everest, you have to climb it alone. I'd say it was an advantage to be the son of a writer. I've had a
chance to see firsthand how rigorous a person has to work to master the craft, how a person must educate himself and what to do when the muse abandons the effort. Due to my mother, I was very lucky to grow up around some great writers, actors, musicians, and dancers of our time. Reciting poetry and prose was an
important aspect of my home life. I really enjoyed having Who appreciated creativity and loved to read. Because she passed that system of love and value to me. As for being an artist, everyone goes through that gate themselves. I'm not sure I'm there yet. For now, I'm just happy to be a writer. The following questions
and discussions are designed to improve your team's reading of Guy Johnson's position in the scratch line. We hope they will provide new insights and ways to look at this epic novel. 1. The period between World War I and World War II was a time when African-Americans began to experience real gains in their status
and wealth, but it was followed by equally cruel reprisals from whites. The King represents this spirit of rebelliousness and his success is met with jealousy and reprisals. Why do his enemies react so strongly to him? It inspires fear among many; Does he inspire love? Do you like or don't like King? Why? 2. When we first
meet King, he is a boy living in Louisiana; From there he travels to France, New York, Louisiana, Oklahoma, and finally San Francisco. Each of these places represents a different phase of his life, from anger and naïveté in the burst of his youth to becoming San Francisco's seasoned businessman. How does King
evolve when he moves around? What's the same left? What changes? 3. King's attempt to live his life on his own terms inevitably conflicts with the inability of others to accept his authority or race. He can't stay in one place or out of the conflict for too long. For all the trouble he causes, does this reluctance jeopardize the
key to his success? What does that say about his future? How about his son Jack is different from him? 4. When Serena discovers Mamie's picture to her husband's power, it is fixated on Mamie's color. Are Serena's feelings enviable or hateful? What role does color play in black society during this period? In the present?
5. King does not cower from violence and does not hesitate to use it against anyone who threatens him. Interestingly, the king rarely initiates violence but automatically returns to it when provoked. Is King the cause of his violent infighting or is he simply responding? Are his actions justified? You think Sergeant McGraw
got what he deserved after spending most of her youth smuggling under her father's roast, Serena feels like she left her past behind by marrying King? But it's King who later accuses her of stalking her father's example. That's right, I'm sorry. Why does she choose to withhold information about King's first son even when
it becomes clear that her children could die as a result? What about Serena and King so different? 7. The King feels some remorse for killing those he believes pose a threat to him, but when people close to him are injured or killed as a result of his actions, he I was in pain. How does King deal with the death of people
like Uncle Jake and Professor? Does the death of his family and friends affect his behavior in any way? Does he accept responsibility for them? Mace, the mayor of Body Wells, resembles a king in spirit and courage, but differs in loyalty. Where the King claims to have no permanent connections, Mace has deep roots in
Boddy Wells. When King kills a deputy, Mas accuses him of unsocibly endangering the city. King argues that the cautious and conciliatory ways of the townspeople only invite more trouble. What makes it easier for King to say that than gas? What are the costs of the action or non-action? Why the black-town psyco? 9.
What characters do Mas, Professor, Philip and his father Claude represent? 10. What does King's relationship with Sampson reveal about him?11. Many of King's goals initially guided his part in their destruction because of his race, only to realize too late that he had exploited the arrogance of their racism. Johnson hints
at the black community's long history of guerrilla warfare and sabotage during slavery and beyond. Discuss this legacy of resistance through manipulation and subversion. How do the characters standing on the scratch line embrace it? 12. Johnson covers a wide range of history standing on the scratch line, moving from
Louisiana in 1916 to California in the 1940s. Describe the changes we see in American society during this period. How does King and Serena's fate reflect these changes? 13. What compels the King to behave as he does?14. Do you understand this novel accurately reflects the racism and prejudice that African-
Americans have experienced in this country? Learn more about standing in a line of storage
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